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 Agenda Item No 4 
 
 Planning and Development Board 
 
 15 August 2011 
 
 Planning Applications 
Report of the   
Head of Development Control 
 
 
1 Subject 
 
1.1 Town and Country Planning Act 1990 – applications presented for determination. 
 
2 Purpose of Report 
 
2.1 This report presents for the Board decision, a number of planning, listed building, 

advertisement, proposals, together with proposals for the works to, or the felling of 
trees covered by a Preservation Order and other miscellaneous items. 

 
2.2 Minerals and Waste applications are determined by the County Council.  

Developments by Government Bodies and Statutory Undertakers are also 
determined by others.  The recommendations in these cases are consultation 
responses to those bodies. 

 
2.3 The proposals presented for decision are set out in the index at the front of the 

attached report. 
 
2.4 Significant Applications are presented first, followed in succession by General 

Development Applications; the Council’s own development proposals; and finally 
Minerals and Waste Disposal Applications.  . 

 
3 Implications 
 
3.1 Should there be any implications in respect of: 
 

Finance; Crime and Disorder; Sustainability; Human Rights Act; or other relevant 
legislation, associated with a particular application then that issue will be covered 
either in the body of the report, or if raised at the meeting, in discussion. 

 
4 Site Visits 
 
4.1 Members are encouraged to view sites in advance of the Board Meeting.  Most can 

be seen from public land.  They should however not enter private land.  If they would 
like to see the plans whilst on site, then they should always contact the Case Officer 
who will accompany them.  Formal site visits can only be agreed by the Board and 
reasons for the request for such a visit need to be given. 

 
4.2 Members are reminded of the “Planning Protocol for Members and Officers dealing 

with Planning Matters”, in respect of Site Visits, whether they see a site alone, or as 
part of a Board visit. 

 
5 Availability 
 
5.1 The report is made available to press and public at least five working days before the 

meeting is held in accordance with statutory requirements. It is also possible to view 
the papers on the Council’s web site www.northwarks.gov.uk  
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5.2 The next meeting at which planning applications will be considered following this 
meeting, is due to be held on Monday, 12 September 2011 at 6.30pm in the Council 
Chamber at the Council House. 
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Planning Applications – Index 
 

Item 
No 

Application 
No 

Page 
No 

Description General / Significant 

 
1 PAP/2010/0236 4 The Vero Works, 36 Station Street, Atherstone  

Redevelopment of the Vero Works and part of the 
Vero and Everitt Factory, comprising retirement 
dwellings, retail units, and a restaurant. 

General 

 
2 PAP/2011/0122 19 Victor Valet Limited, Kingsbury Road, Curdworth  

Display of advertisement consent 
General 

 
3 PAP/2011/0256 26 3 The Green, Austrey, Atherstone  

First floor bedroom and en-suite extension 
General 

 
4 PAP/2011/0270 42 19 Edward Road, Water Orton  

Change of use from A1 to mixed use A1 and hot 
food pizza delivery service and kitchen extension 

General 

 
5 PAP/2011/0286 58 Grendon Fields Farm, Warton Lane, Grendon   

Erection of 1 No. wind turbine and associated 
equipment 

General 

 
6 PAP/2011/0340 

and  
PAP/2011/0342 

78 Shustoke House Barns, Coleshill Road, (B4114)  
Shustoke  
Listed Building Consent for change of use, 
alterations and extension of redundant farm buildings 
for use as a wedding/occasions venue including 
alterations to highway access, access drive and 
creation of car parking 

General 

 
7 PAP/2011/0353 147 West Midland Water Ski Centre, Tamworth Road 

Kingsbury  
Retention of bund and associated works 

General 

 
8 PAP/2011/0370 156 Land Off Lower House Lane Lower House Lane 

Baddesley Ensor  
Variation of condition no:- 3 of planning permission 
NWB/10CC045 to extend the timescales for 
submission of a traffic management scheme 

General 
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General Development Applications 
 
(1) Application No PAP/2010/0236 
 
The Vero Works, 36 Station Street, Atherstone  
 
Redevelopment of the Vero Works and part of the Vero and Everitt Factory, 
comprising retirement dwellings, retail units and a restaurant, for  
 
D F Davies Sipp and Freshspace 
 
Introduction 
 
The report presented to the Planning and Development Board on 18 January 2011 
outlined the proposal for a mixed use scheme at the Vero Works. The report also 
highlighted the potential planning issues to be considered when determining this 
application. The report was written ahead of any consultation responses received 
from statutory consultees or interested parties. The report recommended that a 
Member Site Visit should take place in order to look at the interior of the site. This 
occurred on 26 February 2011. The application is now reported back to the Board for 
determination. The application is accompanied by a draft Section 106 Agreement. 
 
The January report is attached at Appendix A for convenience. 
 
Consultations 
 
Warwickshire Wildlife Trust – It is possible that bats could be using the buildings 
outlined for development. They are a protected species and therefore information is 
provided on the licenses that will be necessary to undertake work near to their 
roosting areas. 
 
Warwickshire Police – No objections to this application and they welcome the 
opportunity of working with the applicant to ensure that the site is a safe environment 
for the residents and users of the shops and restaurant. 
 
Council’s Heritage Officer – In general this is a very welcome scheme which 
potentially represents significant investment in Atherstone that will not only save a 
non-designated heritage asset (the former Willday Hat Factory) of great local 
significance to the town which is at risk, but also bring life and activity back to this 
neglected part of the Conservation Area. He considers that the scheme is sensitive 
to the need to preserve the magnificent long 18th century courtyard elevations as well 
as much of its existing fabric. He considers that the alterations proposed that may 
negatively affect the heritage significance, are limited and justifiable. 
 
Conditions are recommended to reserve the approval of detailed items. 
 
Amended plans have been submitted showing revised materials to be used on the lift 
shaft following on from some of the detail of the Heritage Officer’s observations. The 
new lift core is now to be clad with timber boarding and the roof is to be in metal 
standing with glazed apertures to the centre of the elevation. The Heritage Officer 
has verbally agreed that these amendments are more suitable than the original 
scheme submitted. 
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Council’s Valuation Officer – He agrees that this proposal cannot support any 
contribution for affordable housing and if affordable housing was included it would 
have a serious detrimental effect on the scheme. He agrees that the overall viability 
of the scheme is very risky especially in the present uncertain economic situation. In 
light of the calculations provided, he agrees that to request any further financial 
contributions could result in the scheme not taking place. 
 
Severn Trent Water Ltd – No objection subject to a drainage condition. 
 
The Environmental Health Officer – He states that there are a few anomalies with 
the Noise Report which need to be addressed and that a ground contamination 
survey is required in view of the historical commercial uses of the site. 
 
Further information has been supplied in response to his comments on the noise 
report. He says that this shows that the proposed dwellings would be exposed to 
noise on particular facades, but that it also provides adequate mitigation methods to 
minimise any potential disturbance. He therefore has no objection to the proposal 
and requests conditions covering acoustic double glazing with a minimum rating of 
Rw; ventilation to Units 8-12, 19 and 22-26 shall be provided by mechanical means, 
with a boost facility to negate the need to open windows, and the exact specification 
of the types of double glazing and mechanical ventilation to be approved. 
 
County Highway Authority – The County Council OBJECTS to the scheme for the 
following reasons: 
 

• the Transport Assessment justifies that significant amounts of traffic pass the 
site each day; 

• the lack of off street parking proposed is a concern as only 7 spaces are 
shown when 23 residential units are proposed; 

• the majority of public car parks in Atherstone are already full and many are 
short-stay only and so would not cater for this residential use; 

• the existing access proposed to be used is restricted in width and could not 
accommodate two vehicles passing each other; 

• visibility is restricted due to the width of the footway being below standard and 
therefore the required 2.4 metre setback cannot be attained; 

• the proposal to narrow the carriageway to allow the footpath to be extended in 
width will reduce the width of this bus route which is already below the 
required width of 6.1 metres; 

• access for the secondary entrance/fire escape would appear not to be in the 
control of the applicant along with vehicular access for deliveries; 

• Issues with internal car parking layout and pedestrian routes through the site. 
 
Following this objection, the applicant supplied further information, and the 
Highway Authority has responded to its receipt as follows: 
 
Use of Existing Access 
The Highway Authority had raised concerns about the use of this existing access. It 
is agreed that in all probability, there has been some level of historic use associated 
with the access, and that the site itself has provided car parking space. However the 
additional information that has been received is too vague for it to withdraw its 
objection.  
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Lack of parking 
 
The Highway Authority had raised concerns about the general lack of parking 
provision for the development. The proposal is to use the existing car parks to make 
up for the shortfall of parking. Discussions with the Highway Authority reveal that 
there will be a substantial shortfall and as such further spaces will need to be 
provided and maintained in the public car park opposite. A commuted sum of £10000 
has already been offered by the developer towards the maintenance of these public 
car parks in addition to the £25000 being offered for the contribution towards public 
open space in Atherstone.  
 
Existing footway   
 
The principals of the revisions as indicated on drawing 2087-SK-02 have generally 
been accepted by the Highway Authority subject to a Stage1-2 Road Safety Audit. 
 
Servicing Arrangements 
 
The Highway Authority Engineer has verbally agreed that there is scope to provide a 
lay-by facility off the access serving the Aldi supermarket. However, from the 
additional information received it would appear that no rights of vehicular access 
over the access to Aldi were retained when the area was sold for redevelopment. 
Clearly to access the service area as proposed, and for vehicles to turn so as to re-
enter the public highway in a forward gear, rights of access over the Aldi access 
would be necessary and the Highway Authority would need assurance by way of an 
agreement/easement with the adjacent landowners that this could be attained. Thus, 
evidence is required that Aldi will enter into such an agreement to allow rights of 
access for vehicles to use such a service area. 
 
The Highway Authority also made observations with respect to the emergency 
access and refuse servicing. The guidance for fire appliances is that they should be 
able to access within 45.0 metres of the furthest unit.  
 
With regards to refuse collection, 25.0 metres is the distance over which refuse 
operators will walk from the vehicle to bins/bin storage areas and so any bin storage 
areas need to consider this. 
 
The Highway Authority generally agree that the parking layout is acceptable based 
on the details submitted (Dig 2087-SK-03 & 04) however, the first parking space on 
the left hand-side of the access (block of 3 bays) would create conflict with 
pedestrian using the proposed pedestrian access between the two units. Additionally 
the pedestrian access would not appear to meet DDA requirements. 
 
To prevent vehicles accessing the whole of the site, bollards are required to be 
installed outside the reception area. 
 
Based on the above the Highway Authority concludes that there are issues that 
remain to be satisfactorily addressed before it can remove its objection. 
 
Warwickshire Museum – It recommends that a condition is imposed requiring no 
development to take place until a programme of archaeological work has been 
submitted and approved by the Local Planning Authority. 
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Warwickshire Fire and Rescue – It has no objections to the scheme and 
recommends the imposition of a condition requiring a scheme for the provision of 
adequate water supplies and fire hydrants for fire fighting purposes to be submitted 
for approval. 
 
Representations 
 
Councillor Dirveiks – As local Ward Member she welcomes the scheme to develop 
the old Vero factory and requests that a history display space is set aside in the 
scheme in order to display some of the equipment the factory would have used.  
 
Atherstone Town Council – No objections to this application. However, it would 
wish for the Section 106 Agreement to include the provision of two benches to be 
provided on the green space in front of the public car park; a pedestrian crossing on 
the raised area by the car park, the chimneys re-pointed, and signage around the 
town to stop HGV vehicles taking a route through the town. 
 
Further comments were received following the response from the Highway Authority 
– the Town Council would like to recommend that more parking should be found on 
site. 
 
Atherstone Civic Society – This scheme includes buildings that date back to the 
later part of the 18th Century. They are pleased that a sensitive scheme is proposed 
for their retention and conversion has come forward. They have no objections to the 
proposal. It will also provide homes for the elderly in the centre of the town and trust 
that the car parking provision will be sufficient in view of the elderly persons in 
sheltered accommodation being unlikely to own cars themselves. 
 
Observations 
 
As stated in the report to the Board on 18 January 2011, Saved Local Plan Policy 
ECON6 relates to the redevelopment of this general area of Station Street which 
includes the former hat factory the subject of this planning application. The principle 
of this policy is to stress the importance of this prominent brown field site and its 
allocation for a mixed use development site that needs to deliver environmental 
improvements and revitalise this part of the town.  
 
The report to the January’s Board highlighted the initial key issues emerging from the 
proposed scheme. Following the statutory consultation period, no additional issues 
have emerged over and above those already identified. Therefore, this report will 
now address each of these issues in light of the consultation responses received. 
 

a) Design 
 

The Council’s Heritage Officer generally welcomes this scheme which he considers 
potentially represents significant investment in Atherstone that will not only save a 
non-designated heritage asset (the former Willday Hat Factory) of great local 
significance to the town which is at risk, but also bring life and activity back to this 
neglected part of the Conservation Area. With regards to the redevelopment scheme 
proposed he considers that it is sensitive to the need to preserve the magnificent 
long 18th century courtyard elevations as well as much of its existing fabric. He 
considers that the alterations proposed which might negatively affect this heritage 
significance are limited but justifiable. Atherstone Civic Society also agrees that the 
scheme proposed is sensitive to this historic building and has no objections.  
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With regards to the new elements of the proposal, the Heritage Officer did have 
concerns regarding the design and materials of the lift tower but now welcomes the 
amended plans which show the lift core to be clad with timber boarding and the roof 
to be in metal with glazed apertures to the centre of the elevation. In view of the 
limited footpath width outside the proposed entrance to the restaurant, the applicant 
has agreed to a condition requiring the doorway to be relocated to the elevation 
fronting the Aldi car park and full details are to be submitted at a later stage. This is a 
full planning application and so details can be required to be submitted as part of 
appropriately worded conditions. 
 
Based on the above it is considered that the redevelopment scheme by 
sympathetically using the external fabric of the building will enhance the character, 
appearance and setting of Atherstone Conservation Area as well as retain the 
historic fabric of this former hat factory which dates in part to the later part of the 18th 
century. Such a scheme is considered to comply with Saved Policies ECON6 and 
ENV15 of the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006. 
 

b) Highway and Parking Issues 
 

The Highway Authority has objected to the proposal on a number of grounds. One of 
these is the use of the existing vehicular access onto Station Street. Whilst it accepts 
that historically this access has been used to service the building and accommodate 
parked cars during its use as a B2 factory, it considers that the scale of that use is 
still too vague, for it to be a fall-back consideration of any weight. The applicant’s 
Highway Consultants have drawn up a scheme to increase the width of the footpath 
in the vicinity of the access by altering the carriageway as detailed in Drawing 
Number 2087-SK-02. This increase in footway will not only benefit pedestrians but 
will also improve the visibility splays from the access onto Station Street. The 
Highway Authority has accepted that this new arrangement will be of benefit in 
principle. 
 
The existing and lawful uses of this building and the fact that this vehicular access is 
an existing access are material considerations of weight. It is accepted that the use 
of this access historically would have been low, however, it has and is still capable of 
being used for vehicles to service and park in this area of the site. The proposal is for 
only seven cars to park in this area and use this vehicular access. Such a level of 
use is low. The alternatives would be to either -  1) increase the width and height of 
the vehicular access which would destroy the historic fabric of the building, or 2)  -
close the access to any vehicular traffic. It is considered that some level of parking 
and vehicular drop-off point is required for this site to function as due to the age of 
the residents involved, there will be a need for a drop-off facility for emergency 
services and other transportation services. Amended plan ref: 2451-007 Rev C 
includes three bollards that will prevent further parking within the site. On balance, 
despite the Highway objection to the use of this existing access it is considered that 
a combination of the improvements to visibility splays through widening the footpath, 
limiting the number of vehicles that can park within this area, providing a dedicated 
turning area and the height restriction of the existing access, will all improve the 
safety of this existing access. Conditions can be imposed to ensure that these 
restrictions are implemented. However, there are clearly consequences if this 
position is accepted – namely that there could be an increase in the demand for the 
public car parks in Atherstone.  
 
The Highway Authority also objects to the lack of car parking provided by this 
scheme. As stated above, it is not possible to safely provide additional car parking 
on the site. The application is accompanied by a Transportation Statement which 
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looks at the existing uses in the building and compares their parking requirements 
with the proposed uses. The Highway Authority clearly recognises the parking issues 
in Atherstone with regards to the general lack of long-stay car parking in the town. 
There is a public long-stay car park opposite the site, however, this is usually full. 
The applicant’s Transportation Statement argues that some of the drivers who use 
this public car park are using the existing uses of the building which will be removed 
once the site is developed. The only present users of the building are the gymnasium 
which is likely to remain in some part of the building as the application does include a 
D2 Use. It is accepted that in line with Government advice in its PPG13 document, 
this part of Atherstone is accessible to a variety of modes of travel being within 
walking distance of the bus station, the train station and a taxi rank. The site plan 
shows covered areas for cycles and mobility buggies. The residents of the retirement 
complex are less likely to own a car compared to a younger occupier. It is also 
accepted that the car park opposite the site does have some spaces which are not 
clearly defined and so the applicant has agreed to a one-off payment of £10000 
towards the maintenance of this and other public car parks in the town centre. As 
stressed in Saved Policy TPT6 (Vehicle Parking) and PPG13, on-site parking 
provision in connection with development proposals will be required not to exceed  
maximum standards. On balance, although the car parking provided is very low, it is 
considered that in this town centre location with other modes of travel being 
accommodated along with the commuted sum put forward to ensure that the whole 
of the public car park opposite can be used, this parking provision can be supported. 
 
Finally, the Highway Authority has objected to the servicing arrangements proposed. 
Amended plan ref: 2451-007 Rev C does include a delivery drop-off lay-by which is 
under the ownership of the applicant. There is currently an emergency right of way 
across Aldi’s access road for the occupiers of this building. This will mean that the 
emergency services will be able to access the entire development site. However, the 
Highway Authority is concerned that no rights of access over the access to Aldi were 
retained when the area was sold for redevelopment. As such although a servicing 
lay-by can be provided, it cannot be used. The applicants are currently in discussion 
with Aldi with regard to vehicular access over their land in order to use this service 
lay-by. However, they do not wish for the determination process to be delayed whilst 
these discussions take place. The level of servicing for the proposed restaurant, A1 
and D2 uses will be low. A condition can be imposed to ensure that full details of this 
delivery drop-off lay-by are provided, including its capability of being used, prior to 
the restaurant use being implemented can be imposed to cover this objection. 
 
As stated previously, emergency vehicles can access the front and side of the 
building. Warwickshire Fire and Rescue has requested that a fire hydrant be placed 
within the site. Amended plan ref: 2451-007 Rev C shows such a fire hydrant to the 
rear of the site to overcome this concern. 
 

c) Lack of Affordable Housing Proposed 
 

An Economic Viability Statement has been submitted with the application. The 
Council’s Valuation Officer agrees that the economic viability of the scheme cannot 
support any contributions for affordable housing. He considers that if affordable 
housing was to be included on site then this would have a serious detrimental effect 
to the scheme and so a financial contribution may be the alternative. Nevertheless, 
the whole scheme is very risky in this present uncertain economic situation.   
 
Under Saved Policy HSG2 in the North Warwickshire Local Plan, there is a 
requirement for a minimum of 40% of the housing provided to be affordable housing. 
The advice from the Council’s Valuation Officer is clear in that to request any amount 
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of affordable housing for this scheme will jeopardise the whole of this redevelopment 
scheme.  
 

d) Proposed Mixture of Uses and Issues of Noise and Odours 
 

Saved Policy ECON6 requires a mixed pattern of land uses that will sustain and 
enhance the vitality and viability of the town centre. On the street frontage with 
Station Street, the scheme proposes an A3 Use, two A1 Uses and two D2 Uses. On 
the remainder of the site, 23 retirement residential units are proposed along with two 
D2 (Assembly and Leisure) Units. This will ensure a good mixture of uses for this 
part of the town centre. Saved Policy ENV9 states that places of residence, 
employment or other noise-sensitive uses will not be permitted if the occupants 
would experience significant noise disturbance. Following the receipt of a Noise 
Report, the Environmental Health Officer concludes that the report demonstrates that 
there will be exposure to noise. However the results of the assessment show that the 
proposed dwellings will be exposed to noise on particular facades, and that 
adequate mitigation measures to minimise any potential disturbance can be 
provided. Conditions are recommended to ensure that the present nightclub use is 
removed from the site; that glazing is to a certain standard, and that the D2 Use and 
A3 Use are not permitted to play amplified music. Further details are also requested 
to demonstrate the mitigation measures to be provided for the D2 Use so that it will 
not impact on the adjoining residential units. Based on these conditions, the 
Environmental Health Officer confirms that there are no objections to the proposed 
mixture of uses. 
 

e) Lack of on-site public open space 
 

Due to the size of the site, only a small courtyard can be accommodated to serve as 
a seating area for the occupiers of the site. The site is within walking distance of 
public open space in the town. The applicants have proposed to contribute £25000 
towards the maintenance of this existing public open space. It is considered that this 
amount is sufficient for this redevelopment scheme and will enable the Council to 
work with the Town Council with the aim of implementing their recommendations for 
enhancing the town centre. 
 
Conclusions 
 
Saved Policies ECON6 and ENV15 require a mixed use development scheme in this 
location which enhances the character, appearance and setting of Atherstone’s 
Conservation Area as well as retaining the historic fabric of the existing buildings. 
The consultation responses received reinforce the view that this is a prominent site 
in Atherstone’s Town Centre and as such its re-use is vital to sustain the economic 
vitality and viability of this part of town.  
 
Nevertheless, the Highway Authority has objected to this redevelopment scheme 
from a highway safety point of view. Mitigation measures have been put forward by 
the applicants to address some of the highway concerns but these are not sufficient 
to remove the objection all together. Due to the constraints of the existing building, a 
scheme cannot be designed to address all of the concerns raised by the Highways 
Authority. Members will therefore need to balance this objection against the benefits 
of bringing this redundant building back into use.   
 
The design and mixture of uses is acceptable subject to conditions. There is concern 
about the lack of affordable housing being provided, however, the Council’s 
Valuation Officer’s advice is clear in that to ask for a financial contribution will 
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jeopardise the viability of this scheme. The majority of the building is unoccupied and 
is gradually deteriorating. A considerable amount of grant money has already been 
paid from the Conservation Area Partnership Scheme (CAPs) towards renovating 
the exterior of this building. The Heritage Officer has stated that in order to preserve 
this building it is imperative that work commences shortly on a redevelopment 
scheme.  
 
It is therefore recommended that on balance, Members approve this redevelopment 
scheme subject to the signing of a Section 106 Agreement and subject to conditions 
being imposed. If Members are minded to approve, subject to the draft heads of an 
Agreement as set out below, then it is requested that the exact wording of conditions 
be delegated for later approval by the Chair, Vice Chair and lead spokesperson of 
the opposition.  
 
Recommendation 
 
That subject to the signing of a Section 106 Agreement with the following terms: 
 
£25000 as a contribution towards improvement and/or enhancement of existing off-
site Public Open Space provision in Atherstone and £10000 as a contribution 
towards the maintenance of the public car parks in Atherstone, 
 
then planning permission be approved subject to the conditions with the following 
general wording, but that the exact wording be delegated to officers in consultation 
with the Chair and Vice-Chair of the Board together with the Opposition Planning 
spokesperson. 
 
Conditions 
 
1) Three year time condition 
 
2) Approved Plans  
 
3) Age restriction on those occupying residential units to 55+ 
 
Noise/odour conditions 
 
4) Prior to any residential unit being occupied, all of the existing nightclub use on the 
site shall cease and anything associated with such use shall be removed from the 
building 
 
5) Restriction of restaurant to A3 Use only and no amplified music and regulated 
entertainment whatsoever. 
 
6) Restriction on D2 Use to areas shown on plan only and full details of sound 
insulation measures to units 5, 14 and 15 to mitigate any noise emissions from the 
D2 use. 
 
7) No amplified music from the D2 use 
 
8) Limit floor areas for the A3, A1 and D2 Uses to those specified in the planning 
application 
 
9) Full details of extraction unit to be provided for the kitchen serving the restaurant 
use 
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10) All windows to habitable rooms on the western side of the development shall be 
fitted with acoustic double glazing with a minimum rating of Rw 38dB. All other 
windows to habitable rooms shall be fitted with double glazing with a minimum rating 
of Rw 33dB. 
 
11) Ventilation to Units 8-12, 19 and 22-26 shall be provided by mechanical means, 
with a boost facility to negate the need to open windows. 
 
12) The exact specification of the types of double glazing and mechanical ventilation 
shall be provided to the local authority for approval prior to development. 
 
Design conditions covering: 
 
13) The proposed entrance to the restaurant being relocated to the elevation fronting 

the Aldi car park and full details are to be submitted prior to any works taking 
place; 

 
14) Schedule of windows 
 
15) No windows shall be replaced other than those shown on the approved elevation 

drawings without details first being submitted to and approved in writing by the 
Local Planning Authority. Only the approved details shall be implemented. 

 
16) Full details of external vents and flues 
 
17) Full details of roof lights to be provided 
 
18) Full details of external materials including ground surfaces 
 
19) Full details of external joinery elevations to a minimum of 1:20 sections at 1:2 
 
20) Full details of lift tower, access decks and railings to be submitted 
 
21) Full details of signage/fascias to be provided 
 
22) Full details of the restoration of the freestanding chimney located in the centre of 

the site including details of repointing and removal of vegetation. 
 
23) Drainage condition for the disposal of surface water and foul sewage 
 
24) Programme of archaeological work to be agreed 
 
25) Scheme for the provision of adequate water supply and fire hydrants  
 
26) Details of the history display area to be provided in the A3 use prior to its 

occupation 
 
27) Ground Contamination Survey required  
 
Highway Conditions to be agreed with the Highway Authority 
 
Note on Bats Roosting 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2010/0236 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 The Applicant or Agent Application Forms and Plans Validated 
18/11/10 

2  Press Notice – Atherstone Herald 25/11/10 
3 Councillor Dirveiks E-mail 25/11/10 
4 Atherstone Town Council Consultation response 1/12/10 
5 Warwickshire Wildlife Trust Consultation response 8/12/10 
6 S Wilkinson Board report 18/1/11 
7 J Brown Letter to Agent 18/1/11 
8 Agent E-mail 14/1/11 
9 Agent Letter 3/12/10 

10 Warwickshire Police E-mail 4/1/11 
11 Heritage Officer Consultation response 20/12/10 
12 Council’s Valuation Officer Consultation response 24/12/10 
13 Severn Trent Water Consultation response 9/12/10 
14 Agent Letter 24/1/11 
15 Planning Archaeologist Consultation response 24/1/11 
16 Warwickshire Fire and 

Rescue 
Consultation response 28/1/11 

17 Highways Authority Consultation response 24/1/11 
18 Agent Letter 27/5/11 
19 Highways Authority E-mail 27/5/11 
20 S Wilkinson Letter 15/7/11 
21 S Wilkinson Letter 13/1/11 
22 Agent E-mail 29/6/11 
23 Highways Authority E-mail 12/7/11 
24 Applicant’s Highway 

Engineers 
Letter 14/2/11 

25 Environmental Health 
Officer 

Consultation response 10/12/10 

26 Highways Authority Consultation response 24/1/11 
27 Environmental Health 

Officer 
E-mail 27/7/11 

28 Agent Letter 22/7/11 
 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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(2) Application No PAP/2011/0122 
 
Victor Valet Limited, Kingsbury Road, Curdworth, Warwickshire  
 
Display of advertisement consent, for Mr Christian Humpherson  

Introduction 
 
The application is reported to the Board at officer’s discretion given the history of the 
site and prior refusal of advertisement consent for signs. 
 
The Site 
 
This site is on the southern side of the main A4097 road out of Birmingham heading 
towards the M42 motorway. It is close to the crossroads junction with the Coleshill 
Road and Wishaw Lane in Curdworth opposite the White Horse Public House. It has 
a substantial open grass frontage with a building towards the rear, beyond which are 
residential properties. 
 
The Proposal 
 
This is for the erection of non-illuminated sign measuring 1.5m high by 1.4m wide 
mounted on pole, base of sign will be 4.5m above ground level. The sign will be 
erected within site at the boundary with the public highway verge. 
 
Background 
 
The site is a former petrol station. Planning permission was granted for change of 
use to a vehicle car wash on 05/12/2006. This was subsequently implemented and 
the site is currently used for washing & valeting of cars and lorries. The petrol station 
displayed a totem pole sign, for which advertisement consent was granted in 1974, 
this was located within the public highway verge and has now been removed.  
 
Two previous applications seeking advertisement consent for the display of a pole 
mounted sign in connection with the current use on the were refused in 2009; the 
proposed signs were considered to have an adverse visual impact detrimental to 
amenity.  
 
Development Plan 
 
North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 (Saved Policies) : ENV2 – Green Belt, ENV11 – 
Neighbour Amenities; ENV13 – Building Design and ENV14 – Access Design. 
 
Other Relevant Material Considerations 
 
Planning Policy Guidance Note 2 Green Belts 
Town and Country Planning (Control of Advertisement) Regulations 2007, as 
amended.  
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Consultations 
Warwickshire County Council as Highway Authority - No objection to the sign. 
 
Representations 
 
Curdworth Parish Council – Objection as the sign is out of keeping with the area 
because of its size. 
 
A letter of objection has been received from a local resident referring to its size being 
out of keeping with the area. 
 
Observations 
 
The current application proposes a non-illuminated sign that will comprise solely of 
the logo of the company, Victor Valet. This logo would be a cut out shape of a 
cartoon character, a man, holding a water jet hose. The sign will measure a 1.5m 
high by 1.4m wide and will mounted on steel pole. The base of the sign will be 4.5m 
above ground level. This has been reduced in size from the original proposed sign 
which measured 2m high by 2m wide through the submission of an amended plan. 
 
The sign will be erected within the boundary of the wash facility and will thus be set 
back some distance from the edge of the public highway carriageway.  
 
The applicants believe there is a need for a sign to provide early notification of the 
location of the wash site location for vehicles which need to turn across oncoming 
traffic to enter the site. The applicants would prefer to erect a sign with the verge of 
the public highway; but the consent of the Highway Authority has been withheld, and 
hence this proposal to locate it further back into the site. 
 
The height of the sign is determined by the need to provide sufficient clearance for 
taller vehicles using the wash facility and for it to be visible above mature trees which 
line the approaches on Kingsbury Rd.  
 
The approach to the site along Kingsbury Rd from the east is characterised by a row 
of mature deciduous trees with extensive canopies. These mitigate the visual impact 
of the sign as they mask any views of the site until point is reached some 50m 
distant from the eastern most access to the site. 
 
The approach to the site along Kingsbury Rd from the west is characterised by 
mature trees and hedgerows which mitigate the visual impact of the sign. The sign 
may be visible from a distance of around 100m from the western most access to the 
site, however it would be viewed against a backdrop of the canopies of the taller 
trees lining the eastern approach on Kingsbury Rd which will further mitigate the 
visual impact.  
 
The rear boundary of the application site with Glebe Close is also characterised by 
semi-mature trees. These are of sufficient height to restrict views of the proposed 
sign from street level.  
 
In considering applications for Advertisement Consent, the Regulations require the 
Local Planning Authority to only consider the sign’s impact on amenity and highway 
safety. 
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The Warwickshire County Council Highway Authority has no highway objection, and 
so that leaves the amenity impact. 
 
The application site is on the edge of the settlement of Curdworth and the sign itself 
is in that part of the site that is within the Green Belt.  National planning guidance, 
set out in Planning Policy Guidance Note Number 2, requires that the visual 
amenities of the Green Belt should not be injured by development within or that is 
conspicuous from the Green Belt by virtue of siting, materials or design.  
 
The sign now proposed is significantly smaller than any earlier proposal and would 
be mounted at a lower height than any sign proposed within the previous 
applications. The reduction in size and height serves to increase the effect of the 
mature trees in restricting views of the sign. Overall the visual impact of the sign is 
considered to differ significantly from the visual impact of the signs for which consent 
was refused. The impact of the sign now proposed, by virtue of its size, design and 
position, is not considered to be unduly harmful to the visual amenity of the Green 
Belt or the immediate locality and will not have an adverse impact on highway safety. 
It is also worth noting that the former use did have a number of signs including totem 
signs, and that as a commercial operation is run from the site that there is a 
reasonable requirement for it advertise its business. 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the application be GRANTED subject to the following conditions: 
 
1. No advertisement is to be displayed without the permission of the owner of 
the site or any other person with an interest in the site entitled to grant permission. 

  
REASON 
 
To comply with Regulation 2(1) of the Town and Country Planning (Control of 
Advertisements) Regulations 2007. 
 
2. No advertisement shall be sited or displayed so as to - 
(a) endanger persons using any highway, railway, waterway, dock, harbour or 
aerodrome (civil or military); 
(b) obscure, or hinder the ready interpretation of, any traffic sign, railway signal or aid 
to navigation by water or air; or 
(c) hinder the operation of any device used for the purpose of security or surveillance 
or for measuring the speed of any vehicle. 
  
REASON 
 
To comply with Regulation 2(1) of the Town and Country Planning (Control of 
Advertisements) Regulations 2007. 
 
3. Any advertisement displayed, and any site used for the display of 
advertisements, shall be maintained in a condition that does not impair the visual 
amenity of the site. 
  
REASON 
To comply with Regulation 2(1) of the Town and Country Planning (Control of 
Advertisements) Regulations 2007. 
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4. Any structure or hoarding erected or used principally for the purpose of 
displaying advertisements shall be maintained in a condition that does not endanger 
the public. 
  
REASON 
 
To comply with Regulation 2(1) of the Town and Country Planning (Control of 
Advertisements) Regulations 2007. 
 
5. Where an advertisement is required under these Regulations to be removed, 
the site shall be left in a condition that does not endanger the public or impair visual 
amenity. 
  
REASON 
 
To comply with Regulation 2(1) of the Town and Country Planning (Control of 
Advertisements) Regulations 2007. 
 
6.  The advertisement display hereby approved shall be permanently 
discontinued either on the cessation of the vehicle wash use on the site or on the 
vacation of the site by the current operating company Victor Valet Ltd, whichever is 
the sooner.  The sign and support structures shall be removed from the site within 
three months of the date of the cessation of the vehicle wash use on the site or of 
the date of vacation of the site by Victor Valet Ltd, whichever is the sooner.  
 
REASON 
 
In the interests of amenity.  
 
Justification 
 
The sign now proposed is significantly smaller and will be mounted at a lower height 
than signs proposed within previous applications. The reduction in the size and in the 
height at which it is tp be mounted serves to increase the effect of the mature trees 
in restricting views of the sign. Overall the visual impact of the sign is considered to 
differ significantly from the visual impact of the signs for which consent was refused. 
The impact of the sign now proposed, by virtue of its size, design and position, is not 
considered to be unduly harmful to the visual amenity of the green belt or the 
immediate locality and will not have an adverse impact on highway safety. 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0122 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 The Applicant or Agent Application Forms and Plans 11/3/2011 
& 30/6/2011 

2 WCC Highways Consultation  
3 Curdworth PC Consultation 13/4/2011 & 

15/7/2011 
4 Dixon Representation 28/3/2011 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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(3) Application No PAP/2011/0256 
 
3 The Green Austrey Atherstone  
 
First floor bedroom and en-suite extension, for Mr J Walsh  
Introduction 
 
The application is reported to the Planning and Development Board at the request of 
Local Members who have concerns about the issues involved.  
 
The Site 
 
Number 3 is one half of a pair of semi-detached houses, which may have originally 
formed three farm workers cottages, and is located to the north of and in close 
proximity to St Nicholas’s Church. The other attached dwelling is known as “Rothay”. 
The site is accessed from Main Road, Austrey by a short cul-de-sac known as The 
Green. This leads onto an unadopted lane which runs alongside both number 3 and 
Rothay, by the side of the Church and around the side to the Public House further to 
the south. Rothay is accessed from this lane. There are three other residential 
properties that face The Green. Immediately to the east of the application are two of 
these – two more modern detached houses, numbers 1 and 2 The Green.  The 
general layout and setting is illustrated at Appendix A. 
 
Number 3 faces north, as do numbers 1 and 2. However the two more modern 
houses at numbers 1 and 2 stand forward of the front elevation of number 3. In the 
case of number 2 there is around a 4.5 metre difference. This means that its original 
rear elevation is around 1.5 metres behind the front elevation of number 3. The 
application property has been extended. Apart from a conservatory to the west, 
there are extensions to the east which almost abut the boundary with number 2. 
These are made up of two parts – a single storey extension in front of a two storey 
extension at the rear.  
 
The rear extension extends practically right up to the boundary with number 2. The 
side elevation facing number two is a split gable arrangement. There are two kitchen 
windows in this elevation – both at ground level. The extension is only half of the 
depth of the original house, and this provides the space for a forward single storey 
dining room extension. This has a “mansard” pitched roof around its two sides to 
hide its flat roof. It has a window in its side elevation. A 1.8 metre high metre wooden 
fence marks the ownership boundary with number 2 and this runs between the two 
properties. 
 
The side elevation to number 2 is about one metre from this fence. This house has 
been extended such that it has a single storey rear extension extending back some 
three metres from the original rear house elevation. This has a low pitch tiled roof. 
The extension provides a number of rooms. At the eastern end – that closest to 
number 3 – there is lounge extension. There is a small high level obscurely glazed 
window in the side elevation here. There is also another much larger window in the 
rear elevation serving this lounge extension.  
 
A more detailed plan illustrating these features is at Appendix B, and a series of 
photographs at Appendix C show the two existing extensions at Number 3, and the 
situation at number 2.  
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The Proposals 
 
In short the proposal is to add a first floor extension above the single storey front 
dining room extension described above. It would extend up from the existing side 
and front elevations and be capped with a two pitched roof leading to the provision 
of a valley between it and the existing two storey rear extension which would not be 
altered. Its height would be slightly lower than that ridge.  
 
The new side elevation would contain one additional window. This would be to an 
en-suite at first floor. It is proposed to be obscure glazed but would have an opening 
top light. Additionally, an extra window would be added to the existing side gable of 
the existing two storey rear extension. This is because an existing window to the en-
suite here would be lost if the new extension is constructed. This too would be 
obscurely glazed.  
 
An existing bedroom window at the rear of number 3 is also to be enlarged from 0.6 
metres in width to 0.8 metres. This would face towards Rothay. 
 
Appendix C illustrates in general terms the proposals as described, and Appendix D 
is a copy of the actual plan.  
 
Background 
 
Number 3 also has two rooms within a previous loft conversion. However access to 
these is not via a useable staircase and it would be difficult to use the loft space as 
functional habitable rooms.  
 
Development Plan 
 
Saved Polices of the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 – ENV11 (Neighbour 
Amenities); ENV12 (Urban Design), ENV13 (Building Design) and ENV14 (Access 
Design) 
 
Other Relevant Material Considerations 
 
The Council’s Supplementary Planning Guidance - “A Guide for the Design of 
Householder Development” adopted in September 2003. 
 
Representations 
 
Austrey Parish Council – The Parish Council indicates that it feels unable to make a 
recommendation. 
 
Objections and representations have been received from the neighbouring occupiers 
at Numbers 1 and 2 The Green, as well as from the occupiers of Rothay, Austrey. 
The nature of the issues raised can be summarised as follows: 
 
• Inaccuracy of plans - The plans are considered to be incorrect. They show 

Number 3 as only having two bedrooms, whereas there is a third where the 
“study” is marked and the two attic bedrooms in the loft conversion are not 
shown. This would make a five bedroom house. The site location plan boundary 
is wrong.  (This however has now been addressed following receipt of a revised 
plan). 
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• Privacy - The east side elevation of the extension has two windows at first floor 

level that will overlook the rear garden at Number 1 where the occupiers 
currently enjoy “total privacy”. This extension compromises privacy and 
overlooks the garden. The side elevation at Number 3 would come right up to 
the boundary fence at Number 2.  Number 2 is already very close to this 
boundary. The two new first floor windows would directly overlook the rear 
garden and into the rear bedroom. Even although these would be obscure 
glazed, because these will be opening windows in compliance with fire 
regulations, there is still the potential for overlooking and loss of privacy.   

 
• Design and appearance - The existing property has been sympathetically 

extended, has character and is within keeping of the surrounding properties. 
This application changes the character of the cottage to a “modern box”. It 
changes the vernacular of the lane. The current side elevation of Number 3 
already creates an oppressive and overbearing aspect. This is mitigated by the 
existing single storey extension. A further two storey extension would be 
adverse to the character of the environment at the rear of Number 2, and would 
totally enclose the garden. It would have a negative aesthetic impact for the 
occupiers of Number 2, presenting them with a bulky, continuous and 
overbearing brick wall along much of the side of their garden. Number 3 has 
already undergone substantial extension with a loss of its rural charm.  

 
• Parking and Safety - During construction there will be considerable disruption 

due to parking.  The un-adopted lane becomes a public footpath and is a 
thorough fare to the church; it is used by villagers and children for access, 
(running from the local shop, the pub and the church). Currently when the 
applicant has visitors they park in The Green as there is no room on the 
applicant’s property. The existing cul-de-sac is already subject to traffic and 
parking congestion, in addition emergency vehicles would not have easy access 
to properties further up the lane. If the parking and vehicular access at Number 
3 is not sufficient for vehicle turning, and given the number of people who could 
be potentially accommodated as a result of the proposed extension - it will lead 
to 5/6bedrooms, to accommodate 9 people - this might put pressure on parking 
and lead to safety hazards for pedestrians, exacerbating existing problems.  

 
• Daylight and sunlight – This is already impaired on the south westerly aspect of 

Number 2 due to the substantial extension at the application property. The 
existing single storey extension at Number 3 gives a critical opening which 
permits afternoon and evening sunshine to the rear of the property and garden. 
The proposed two storey extension will close off this gap and complete the full 
overshadowing over this side. It will affect the use and enjoyment of the rear 
garden, but will also block the provision of natural light into the rear living room, 
as this room has west facing windows to provide afternoon and evening 
sunlight. The extension will fully and directly block this light from the south-west 
to a living room, rear bedroom and garden. 

 
• Noise – The utility room at Number 3 is directly underneath the bathroom at 

Rothay. It is not insulated against noise transference. Any increase in 
occupancy is likely to affect the amenity by increased noise in this room. 
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• Water supply and Party Wall Act – The proposal includes an en-suite. Number 3 

shares its water supply with Rothay. There is a single water pipe that runs under 
Rothay from Church Lane and then continues to Number 3. The extension 
would mean a need for access. Should permission be granted the occupier at 
Rothay would require the applicant make a written request for permission to 
access should he wish to carry out external works. There is no objection to the 
size of the window being increased. 

 
Observations 
 
The application site is within the development boundary defined for Austrey by the 
Development Plan and thus there is no objection in principle to further extensions at 
the property. The main issues raised here are the amenity impact of the extension on 
neighbouring occupiers and the appearance of the extension. It is considered that 
the main impact of the extension would be on the neighbouring occupier at Number 
2.  
 
It is therefore considered appropriate to run through the representations that have 
been received. 
 
Firstly it is necessary to look at the proposal in terms of the overall design and 
appearance. The property is an older cottage and displays many of the features that 
one would expect in Warwickshire traditional architecture. However, the property has 
been much altered and extended. It is not a Listed Building and neither is it within a 
Conservation Area. It also is adjacent to more modern housing and within an area 
where there is a variety of house type and appearance. The proposed works 
however would add significantly to the overall mass of the building and they would 
be to the front. As a consequence they will alter the balance and appearance of the 
property. The issue is whether this is sufficient in itself to refuse planning permission. 
It is thus necessary to examine the other issues raised before concluding on this 
one. 
 
The issue concerning the potential loss of privacy revolves around the two new 
windows at first floor level – one in the proposed extension and the second being in 
the existing extension. These are to be obscurely glazed as they would serve en-
suites. The top light would be an opening light but these would be small and at a 
high level. Additionally, within any residential area there is inevitably a degree of 
overlooking with adjacent rear gardens. In this case, the degree of over looking is not 
considered to be so material to warrant a refusal. 
 
The potential loss of light however is of more concern. It is not considered that the 
proposals would materially affect either Rothay or number 1 The Green in this 
respect. It is the possible impact on the immediately adjoining property at number 2 
which is the main concern. This is to the east of the proposed works around 1 to 1.5 
metres of the actual building line. Number 2 has also been extended with a rear 
single storey extension.  It is first proposed to look at the potential affect on light 
entering the existing rooms of number 2. There are no existing openings in the side 
gable of number 2 which faces the proposed extension. There is however a small 
high level obscure glazed window in the side of the rear extension. The light entering 
this window is already affected by the existing extension and the proposed would 
materially affect the degree of natural light entering the room from this window 
because of the height of the proposed works and their proximity. However this is 
mitigated to some degree by the facts that the window is already small; it already has 
obscure glazing and that it is not the main opening to that room. The room benefits 
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from light entering from its rear window. It is considered that it is unlikely that this 
rear window would be affected by the proposed works because of the location of that 
window in relation to the proposed extension. There is a rear first floor bedroom 
window above, in the original rear elevation of number 2. Light entering this window 
is already affected by the existing extension. This would be worsened by the 
proposed extension as it is located “behind” those works. So in conclusion on this 
issue, there would be a loss of light into the rear ground floor room of the 
neighbouring property at number 2 as well as one of the rear bedrooms. 
 
It is now necessary to look at the potential loss of light into the garden at number 2. 
This garden is to the east of the proposed works, and thus it is the afternoon and 
evening periods that are more relevant here.  It is evident that the existing two storey 
side extension to the application site already casts a shadow during the afternoon 
and evening over part of the garden. Therefore there is already overshadowing. The 
issue is whether this would be made worse. The proposed works are at the front of 
number 3 and the existing extension and house are very close to the common 
boundary. As a consequence the proposed extension would not necessarily 
exacerbate overshadowing to the neighbour’s rear garden because the additional 
shadow would predominantly be cast over the number 2’s existing single storey rear 
extension rather than directly over the garden. There will be an impact, but it is not 
considered that alone it constitutes a reason for refusal. 
 
Whilst the foregoing suggests on balance that the proposed works might be 
acceptable, consideration has not yet been given to perhaps the main concern here 
– that is the amenity impact of a far greater bulk or mass of built form immediately 
adjacent to number 2. The existing side gable extension at number 3 is significantly 
large and immediately abuts the property boundary. The additional works will reduce 
further any remaining feeling of openness. This loss would be perceived elsewhere 
in the rear garden because of the cumulative mass and perhaps more importantly, 
the proximity of the total built form. This has the side effects referred to above – the 
overall character of the application property is affected; the loss of natural light into 
the small side window at Number 2, the loss of some light into a rear bedroom, and 
the potential additional overshadowing of this same property. In other words the 
proposed extension would be overpowering and over dominant, materially affecting 
the residential amenity of the occupiers of number 2.  
 
Other matters raised by the representations need to be looked at to see if they too 
would have any additional effects. 
 
In respect of the parking issue, then the proposed extension would not necessarily 
itself increase the need for additional vehicles. However if there is increased traffic, 
then there is ample space at number 3 for increased car parking spaces to be 
provided thus reducing the likelihood of increased cars parking in the cul-de-sac. 
Construction traffic would be a short term inconvenience, which would occur with any 
building work undertaken at any of the houses in The Green if their occupiers wished 
to extend. It is not considered that potential increased noise from a greater number 
of occupants is relevant to the planning issues surrounding the extension. There is 
no change of use proposed. More importantly, this could be the subject of other 
legislation if necessary. 
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On the matter relating to the Party Wall Act then these arrangements need to be 
settled outside of consideration of the planning issues involved in this case. In 
respect to the inaccuracy of plans then revised plans have addressed the concerns 
raised by neighbours, albeit that plans do not show the layout of the roof space. The 
key issue here for the Board is the external impact of the proposed works, not the 
accuracy of the internal room arrangements. In respect of water supply then the 
utilities arrangements here are not a material planning consideration, again needing 
resolution privately between the parties. 
 
As a consequence of this, it is considered that the proposed works would have an 
adverse impact on the residential amenity that any occupier of number 2 might 
reasonable expect to enjoy. That comes about due the scale of the proposal; the 
existing extensions and importantly the proximity of the works to number 2. 
 
Recommendation 
 
That planning permission be REFUSED for the following reason: 
 
1) It is considered that the extension will have overbearing impact on the residential 
amenity that the occupiers of the adjoining property could reasonably be expected to 
enjoy. This is because of the size and mass of the proposed works; the cumulative 
impact when the existing extension at the premises is taken into account, and the 
proximity of the proposed works and the existing extension to the neighbouring 
property’s rear rooms and rear garden. The extension results in a dominant 
development that reduces openness and increases the sense of enclosure at the 
rear of number 2; impacts on the degree of natural light entering rear rooms at 
number 2 and increases the likelihood of overshadowing of that property’s rear 
garden. The proposal therefore does not accord with saved Policy ENV11 of the 
North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006.   
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0256 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 Mr & Mrs Cooke Letter of representation 4 June 2011 
2 Austrey Parish Council E-mail of representation 13 June 2011 
3 Mr Fish E-mail and letter of 

representation 
13 June 2011 

4 Case Officer Letter to Agent 23 June 2011 
5 Applicant  Letter in response to 

representations received 
23 June 2011 

6 Mr & Mrs McEvoy E-mail of representation 24 June 2011 
7 Applicant E-mail in response to 

representations received 
26 June 2011 

8 Case Officer E-mail information on progress of 
application 

5 July 2011 

9 Case Officer E-mail to Mr Fish on consultation 
of revised site location plan 

5 July 2011 

10 Mr Fish E-mail indicating error on revised 
site location plan 

6 July 2011 

11 Applicant E-mail in response to 
representations received 

6 July 2011 

12 Case Officer E-mail to agent requesting 
revision to site location plan 

7 July 2011 

13 Agent E-mail revised site location plan 7 July 2011 
14 Case Officer E-mail to Mr Fish on correct 

version of site location plan 
7 July 2011 

15 Mr Fish E-mail to indicate site location 
plan is correct 

7 July 2011 

16 Councillorl Humphries E-mail response from applicant to 
representations received 

7 July 2011 

16 Case Officer E-mail to agent and applicant 
informing them of officers 
observations 

8 July 2011 

17 Case Officer E-mail Officers observations to 
Local Members and Chair and 
Vice Chair of the P & D Board 

8 July 2011 

18 Councillor May E-mail notification - due to 
controversy is ok for the 
recommendation to be 
considered by Planning & 
Development Board 

11 July 2011 

19 Councillor Humphries Application to go to Planning & 
Development Board? 

12 July 2011 

20 Case Officer E-mail response for material 
planning reasons to take 
application to P & D Board 

12 July 2011 

21 Councillor Humphries E-mail request for application to 
go to Planning & Development 
Board 
 
 

13 July 2011 
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22 Mr & Mrs McEvoy E-mail to confirm that original 
representation still relevant 
 
 

14 July 2011 

23 Mr Fish 
 

E-mail to revise initial 
representation which removes 
issue relating to boundary line 
only. 

17 July 2011 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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(4) Application No PAP/2011/0270 
 
19 Edward Road, Water Orton  
 
Change of use from A1 to a mixed use (A1) and hot food pizza delivery service 
with a kitchen extension for 
 
Mr Naveed Malik - Malik Convenience Store 
 
Introduction 
 
The application is brought before the Planning and Development Board as the 
application property is owned by the Borough Council.  
 
The Site 
 
The building is an existing convenience shop, contained within an existing housing 
estate which is to the east of the centre of Water Orton. The shop has car parking to 
the front and is surrounded by residential dwelling houses. To the side is an access 
to a garage block.  
 
The Proposal 
 
This is to change the use from an A1 retail use to a mixed use comprising A1 and a 
hot food pizza delivery service with an associated kitchen extension. The proposal 
would not increase the footprint of the building, and would use an existing room to 
the rear of the building to install the pizza equipment. The pizza business would be 
delivery only. To the rear of the building an external duct and vertical flue are 
proposed so to deal with smells an odours, the overall height of which would be 
approxiamtely 7.1 metres. 
 
Background 
 
The building was constructed at the same time as the estate in which it is sited, and 
there are no previous planning applications relating to the premises. 
 
Development Plan 
 
Saved Policies of the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006: - ENV11 (Neighbour 
Amenities), ENV12 (Urban Design), ENV14 (Access Design), ENV9 (Air Quality) and 
ECON5 (Facilities relating to settlement hierarchy) 
 
Other Relevant Material Considerations 
 
Supplementary Planning Guidance:  Water Orton Design Statement – Adopted 
February 2003 
 
Consultations 
 
Environmental Health Officer –No objection subject to final details of the flue being 
agreed. 
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Representations 
 
Objections have been received from 9 local addresses. The matters raised include:  
 

• The plans provided are not accurate. 
 

• Will the existing customer parking be road marked to improve safe parking? 
 

• Are there any restrictions on customer parking away from the commercial 
premises? 

 
• Will the pizza delivery car parking interfere with free vehicular access to the 

garages? 
 

• The application forms are misleading as they are in 2 different formats. 
 

• The development is likely to increase vehicular/motorcycle traffic movements 
in a residential area in which young children and elderly people reside. 
Parking facilities are already overloaded in the area on occasions. 

 
• The development is likely to increase noise nuisance in an area in which 

elderly people reside, due to the increase in the use of the shop and from the 
making of the pizzas’. 

 
• The development of commercial regular cooking facilities is likely to cause an 

odour smell nuisance. The kitchen area is surrounded by residential 
properties. 

 
• The development of food take away is likely to cause a littering nuisance. 

Opportunity for people to go into the shop and order pizza and eat outside 
 

• The application form implies an extra 30 minutes opening time from the 
current closing time of 22:00 hours to 22:30 hours, which will extend the 
nuisance time. 

 
• Although the current tenants of the shop appear in control of the current 

situation around the shop, there were problems with disturbances from 
public/customers around the shop under previous tenants of which the police 
are aware. The proposed development could contribute to an increase in anti-
social behaviour in this vicinity. 

 
• Problem with the drainage in the area. 

 
• Potential for new illuminated lighting. 

 
• The change of use implies an intent to attract additional business which in 

turn implies additional customers, some of which may be from outside of the 
estate and vicinity, which will result in additional disturbance to the residential 
area. 

 
• Is this application setting a precedent for change of use by other premises in 

the residential area? 
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• The landlord is North Warwickshire Borough Council and in the letter of the 4 
May 2011, permission to this change of use has been given subject to certain 
conditions. It is unlikely that all these conditions will be met. 

 
• The site should remain as an A1Type Development, Shop (Convenience 

store) only. 
 

• There are sufficient fast food delivery services in and around the village and 
surrounding area, and the proposal will impact upon the area. 

 
• The proposal will devalue the neighbouring residential properties.  

 
• The proposed use is not within keeping of the residential area. 

 
• No details of the soak away have been provided as part of the application, 

and given the geology of the area the water table is high. 
 

• The visual amenity of the flue and works are industrial in design. 
 
142 letters of support have also been received. Of these 99 were from addresses in 
the immediate neighbourhood, with the remainder from other properties within Water 
Orton as well as from addresses in Gilson, Shustoke, Coleshill, Castle Bromwich 
and Birmingham. 
 
Observations 
 
It is important to note that the site already contains an existing convenience shop 
and that this is sited within a residential area. The nearest other shop or takeaway is 
either in Coleshill or in the parade of shops close to the centre of Water Orton. 
 
The shop is at the junction of George Road and Edward Road. The existing shop is 
surrounded by residential properties, and has an existing closing time of 10pm. 
Selected photographs of the application site can be viewed at Appendix 1. 
 
The proposal will lead to an existing rear room being converted in order to prepare 
pizzas, with an external extract flue and vertical pipe to the rear of the building, as 
shown in Appendix 2. The internal extract fan would be above the oven and fryer, 
which would then go via external ducting to this vertical flue. The height of the flue is 
controlled by Environmental Regulations which state that the top of the flue must be 
at least 1 metre above existing windows on the building, and as the building has first 
floor accommodation, the flue has to exceed the roof eaves height to comply. The 
height of the flue above ground level is 7.1 metres. The ridge line here is some 9 
metres. The ducting and flue are proposed to control the noise and odour produced, 
with the odour going into the extract hood inside the building and a silencer outside 
for the noise of the fan. The duct outside is proposed to have anti-vibration mounts 
and flexible coupling so to reduce noise nuisance to neighbouring properties. As part 
of the ducting a carbon box system would be used to reduce odour. When 
considering these proposals against saved planning policy ENV9, it is considered 
that the proposal is acceptable given that the Environmental Health Officers have 
raised no objections. 
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The design of the rear ducting and flue is industrial in nature and due to the 
regulations the height is defined. However it is to the rear of the building and this will 
significantly reduce the visual impact upon the street scene. The applicant has set 
out a revised siting for the flue which is satisfactory in attempting to minimise its 
impact.   
 
The pizza business as proposed would be delivery only and would not involve 
customers coming to the shop to collect their orders. The Borough Council is the 
landlord of the shop and as landlord has agreed the introduction of the pizza service 
as part of the shop services subject to the criteria as set out in Appendix 3. One of 
these is to obtain planning permission. This is the letter referred to by one of the 
objectors. 
The operating hours proposed for the pizza delivery service are from 1000 until 
2230, whereas the existing shop closes at 2200. It is considered that consistent 
hours would help all parties here and be of overall environmental benefit.  
 
The issues raised by the representations relate to the actual operation of the pizza 
delivery service; the parking and highway impacts, its impact upon the neighbouring 
properties, the opening hours, and other issues as referred to above.  
 
It is considered that as the main use of the ground floor would still function as a shop 
to serve local residents, and that as the pizza delivery service would be part of the 
ground floor to the rear of the shop, that the introduction of the new use is 
appropriate in principle. When considering planning policy ECON5, new A4 and A5 
uses are normally directed to town centres. However in this case, there is a material 
factor in that there is an existing lawful use for the premises here as a convenience 
store with all of its attendant comings and goings and the longer than usual opening 
hours. There are a number of existing take away premises in Water Orton, but 
competition between different occupiers is not a planning matter. The cumulative 
impact of having a number of takeaways sited together might well justify a refusal if it 
can be shown that a further such use would exacerbate existing adverse impacts 
arising directly from such uses. This is not the case here, as the other takeaways in 
Water Orton and the nearby settlement of Coleshill are some distance from the 
application site.   
 
The site does lie within an existing residential area, and it is understood that there 
were previous issues related to the previous owners. However the Borough Council 
owns the property and as landlord could terminate the use or indeed the tenancy if 
considered appropriate, notwithstanding the planning situation. 
 
The impact of noise, amenity and impact upon the neighbouring properties is an 
important consideration. Members are reminded that the lawful use of the building is 
as a shop and therefore the number of vehicles that turn up cannot be controlled or 
assumed at any part of the day. There is existing car parking to the front of the shop 
for customers with two spaces to the side for the staff and one space proposed to 
the side of the building close to the entrance to the garages for the pizza delivery 
vehicle. This is considered adequate for the existing use and indeed for the 
proposed use too. 
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To the rear of the site are residential properties in Hollyhurst, and the nearest 
dwelling is approximately 15 metres from the proposed flue. To the side, the nearest 
property in Edward Road is also about 15 metres away. On the other side of the 
shop, the nearest property in George Road is some 28 metres distant. Given these 
distances, the boundary vegetation and controls on the noise and smell leaving the 
proposed pizza use through the Environmental Health regime, it is considered that 
there is unlikely to be a significant impact upon amenity.   
 
Above the shop is a flat, and the occupier’s residential amenity has to be considered. 
The flue is sited away from the nearest window and 1 metre higher that the existing 
first floor windows. Given the noise and odour control of the proposal and given that 
the ground floor is an existing shop, the proposal is considered to be acceptable in 
this case. 
 
One of the main objections from the neighbouring properties is that the pizza delivery 
service would lead to an increase in vehicle numbers as customers would treat it as 
a “take-away”, increased littering and an increase in anti- social behaviour. It is 
considered that given the proposal is for delivery only; no additional littering would be 
likely. More importantly the building is already a shop, which is open for a number of 
hours each day and which closes at 2200. It could attract numbers of car born 
customers regardless of whether the pizza service is introduced or not. Indeed a 
Tesco Express or similar could operate here without the need for any planning 
application and this could lead to significant car born custom. This is a significant 
“fall-back” position. The front of the shop has space for up to five vehicles and this is 
not proposed to be affected.  The concern is clearly the likelihood of this becoming a 
takeaway service. This is not considered to be a reason for refusal – firstly the 
existing use itself could attract significant car born traffic particularly if its nature 
changed; secondly the use of planning conditions can be imposed and thirdly, the 
property is owned by the Borough Council. It is therefore considered that the matters 
raised by the representations could not be transferred into planning reasons for 
refusal. 
 
Another matter was raised by an objector - the drainage of the area. The proposed 
use would not materially affect existing drainage and it is considered that if there are 
existing drainage problems here then these are best dealt with by the Councils 
Housing team. The proposal itself is not considered to lead to an increased runoff 
into the soak away, given that no extension is proposed to the building. 
 
In considering the other comments and objections, the application does not seek to 
install any signage, and this would have to be considered under a separate 
Advertisement application. The proposal would not lead to a precedent being set for 
other buildings being used for similar uses, as each case is taken on its own merits, 
and in this case it is material that a convenience store already exists within the 
residential area.  
 
The application is thus recommended for approval, but subject to conditions. These 
in particular will relate to control over the use; the opening hours, and that the store 
building is only used for storage. 
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Recommendation 
 

That the application be GRANTED planning permission subject to the following 
conditions: 
 
1. The development to which this permission relates must be begun not later 
than the expiration of three years from the date of this permission. 
  
REASON 
 
To comply with Section 91 of the Town and Country Planning Act 1990, as 
amended by Section 51 of the Planning and Compulsory Purchase Act 2004, and 
to prevent an accumulation of unimplemented planning permissions. 
 
2. The development hereby approved shall not be carried out otherwise than in 
accordance with layout plan received by the Local Planning Authority on 14th 
July 2011, parking plan  received by the Local Planning Authority on 18th July 
2011, site location plan received by the Local Planning Authority on 19th July 
2011 and the ventilation system side elevation and ventilation system rear 
elevation received by the Local Planning Authority on 27th July 2011. 
  
REASON 
 
To ensure that the development is carried out strictly in accordance with the 
approved plans. 
 
3. This permission relates solely to the introduction of a new use to these 
premises for the delivery of pizzas and specifically not for a pizza “take-away” 
use. 
 
REASON 
 
In the interests of the environmental and highway amenities of the area. 
 
4. There shall be no pizza delivery service operated from these premises 
between 2200 hours and 1000 hours on any day. 
  
REASON 
 
To prevent disturbance to the occupiers of nearby properties. 
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Notes 
 

1. The submitted plans indicate that the proposed works come very close to, or 
abut neighbouring property.  This permission does not convey any legal or 
civil right to undertake works that affect land or premises outside of the 
applicant's control.  Care should be taken upon commencement and during 
the course of building operations to ensure that no part of the development, 
including the foundations, eaves and roof overhang will encroach on, under or 
over adjoining land without the consent of the adjoining land owner. This 
planning permission does not authorise the carrying out of any works on 
neighbouring land, or access onto it, without the consent of the owners of that 
land.  You would be advised to contact them prior to the commencement of 
work. 
 

2. You are recommended to seek independent advice on the provisions of the 
Party Wall etc., Act 1996, which is separate from planning or building 
regulation controls, and concerns giving notice of your proposals to a 
neighbour in relation to party walls, boundary walls and excavations near 
neighbouring buildings.  An explanatory booklet entitled "The Party Wall etc., 
Act 1996" is available from Her Majesty's Stationary Office (HMSO), Bull 
Street, Birmingham, during normal opening hours or can be downloaded from 
the Communities and Local Government web site - 
http://www.communities.gov.uk/publications/planningandbuilding/partywall. 
 

3. The Development Plan policies which are relevant to this Decision are as 
follows: 
North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 (Saved Policies) : ENV11 - Neighbour 
Amenities, ENV12 - Urban Design, ENV14 – Access Design, ENV9 - Air 
Quality, ECON5 - Facilities relating to settlement hierarchy  
 

4. Advertisement Consent is required under a separate procedure of the Town 
and Country Planning Act 1990.  Should any advertisements, signs, name 
boards, or other devices to attract attention, be intended in respect of this 
development, the Local Planning Authority will be pleased to advise you on all 
associated aspects prior to the erection of any such advertisements, and 
provide you with application forms. 

 
 
Justification 
 
The site is within a residential area but benefits from a lawful use within Use Class 
A1 (retail). It is not considered that the impacts arising from the mixed use (A1 and 
pizza delivery service) are so materially different from those arising from the 
continuation of that lawful use so as to warrant refusal. Conditions are proposed 
covering hours and the use of the pizza delivery service. The proposal is considered 
not to result in a loss of privacy, light or amenity to the neighbouring properties, 
which would lead to an unacceptable adverse impact. The rear ducting and flue to 
extract is considered to be appropriate, given the noise and odour reduction 
measures contained within it, so to result in no external impacts upon the 
neighbouring properties. The proposal thus accords with saved policies ECON5, 
ENV9, ENV11, ENV12 and ENV14 of the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006. 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0270 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 The Applicant or Agent Application Forms and Plans Valid 27/6/11 
2 Residential properties 142 comments of support Between 

7/7/11 and 
25/7/11 

3 NWBC Environmental 
Health 

Email to agent 1/7/11 

4 Case Officer Visit application site and put up 
site notice 

4/7/11 

5 Case officer Letter to applicant 5/7/11 
6 16 Edward Street Objection 9/7/11 
7 7 Edward Street Objection 4/7/11 
8 5 Hollyhurst, Watton Lane Objection 4/7/11 
9 9 Park Grove Objection 10/7/11 

10 Case officer Letter to applicant 11/7/11 
11 Applicant Letter and plan provided 14/7/11 
12 Case officer Letter to applicant 15/7/11 
13 Case officer Email to NWBC Environmental 

Health 
14/7/11 

14 Applicant Copy of letter from Housing 14/7/11 
15 Applicant Letter and information 18/7/11 
16 Case officer Email to applicant 18/7/11 
17 NWBC Environmental 

Health 
Email to case officer 18/7/11 

18 Email to NWBC 
Environmental Health 

Case Officer 18/7/11 

19 100 George Street Objection 19/7/11 
20 17 Edward Street Objection 19/7/11 
21 NWBC Environmental 

Health 
Email to case officer 19/7/11 

22 15 Edward Road Comments 20/7/11 
23 Applicant Email and copy of letter from 

NWBC Housing 
19/7/11 

24 16 Edward Road Objection 24/7/11 
25 Applicant Email to case officer 27/7/11 
26 Case officer Email to applicant 28/7/11 
27 Case officer Letter/email to NWBC Housing 27/7/11 
28 Case officer Email/letter to neighbour 28/7/11 
29 Applicant Email to case officer 28/7/11 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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APPENDIX 1 – SELECTED PHOTOGRAPHS OF THE SITE 
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APPENDIX 2 – PLANS  
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APPENDIX 3 – LETTER FROM NWBC HOUSING 
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(5) Application No: PAP/2011/0286 
 
Grendon Fields Farm, Warton Lane, Grendon   
 
Erection of 1 No. wind turbine and associated equipment,  
 
for Mr Timothy Thirlby 
 
Introduction 
 
This application is reported to Board given the sensitivity of the proposal and 
representations received to date. This report is intended as an interim report only, as 
the consultation period is presently continuing and a formal assessment of the 
proposal underway. 
 
The Site 
 
The proposed siting is to the rear of the farm upon a slight rise from the valley 
bottom, which carries the River Anker. It is open to aspects in nearly all directions, 
with a small wooded area to the north-west obscuring views somewhat. The 
surrounding land is primarily in agricultural use, with arable fields and pasture along 
the valley. The Coventry Canal also passes along the valley, with the West Coast 
Mainline and A5 beyond this. There are public footpaths and bridleways which offer 
aspects of the site, although these are either at some distance, or pass to the north 
through the farm itself. 
 
The nearest clusters of residential properties off the farm are to the north-west, 
beyond the woodland, in the historic settlement of Grendon; and to the south-west in 
the more recent parts of Grendon (along the A5) and Baddesley Ensor – the latter of 
which offers elevated views across the valley towards the site. There are further 
isolated properties around the area, and dwellings to the north-west edge of 
Atherstone also have some aspects. 
 
The Proposal 
 
It is intended to erect one 46m to tip (36m to hub) wind turbine and associated 
monitoring/control equipment. The turbine will primarly provide for the needs of the 
farm holding, which has a high demand given the livestock buildings and equestrian 
business, before feeding surplus electricity into the national grid. 
 
Background 
 
The proposal has been assessed in respect of the Environmental Impact 
Assessment (EIA) Regulations 1999. Whilst the proposal is classed as development 
under paragraph 3(i) of Schedule 2 to the Regulations, it has been concluded that 
due to the lesser scale of this wind turbine (compared to full scale wind farms); the 
significant distance to residential receptors; a lack of statutory and local constraints 
in respect of ecology, heritage, aviation and land designations; and the presence of 
adequate statements and information to address any residual environmental 
concerns, that the development is not considered to be EIA development such that 
the submission of an Environmental Statement is not required. 
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Development Plan 
 
North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 (Saved Policies): Core Policy 2 (Development 
Distribution), Core Policy 3 (Natural and Historic Environment), Core Policy 11 
(Quality of Development), ENV1 (Protection and Enhancement of Natural 
Landscape), ENV3 (Nature Conservation), ENV4 (Trees and Hedgerows), ENV6 
(Land Resources), ENV8 (Water Resources), ENV9 (Air Quality), ENV10 (Energy 
Generation and Energy Conservation), ENV11 (Neighbour Amenities), ENV12 
(Urban Design), ENV16 (Listed Buildings, Non-Listed Buildings of Local Historic 
Value and Sites of Archaeological Importance (including Scheduled Ancient 
Monuments) and TPT1 (Transport Considerations In New Development). 
 
West Midlands Regional Spatial Strategy (Phase 1 Revisions January 2008): 
POLICY EN1 (Energy Generation) 
 
Other Relevant Material Considerations 
 
Government Advice: PPS22 (Renewable Energy), Planning for Renewable Energy – 
A Companion Guide to PPS22, Overarching National Policy Statement for Energy 
(EN-1), National Policy Statement for Renewable Energy Infrastructure (EN-3), The 
Assessment and Rating of Noise from Wind Farms (ETSU-R-97: September 1996). 
 
Consultations 
 
A number of statutory consultees and qualified bodies have been approached. 
These include Ministry of Defence, Birmingham Airport, Coventry Airport, East 
Midlands Airport, Campaign for the Protection of Rural England (CPRE), 
Warwickshire Wildlife Trust, RSPB, NWBC Environmental Health, Grendon Parish 
Council and Sheepy Parish Council. 
 
A total of 1163 notification letters were sent to properties in the surrounding area and 
across the border into Hinckley and Bosworth following the Case Officer establishing 
from where views of the proposal could be possible. 
 
A site notice was erected at the access to the farm on 20 June 2011, which expired 
on 11 July 2011. 
 
Local members of the Baddesley and Grendon, Dordon, Polesworth East and 
Atherstone North Wards, along with the Chair and Vice Chair of the Planning Board 
were notified of the application on 20 June 2011. 
 
Representations 
 
All three airports consulted raise no objection to the proposal with the turbine sitting 
outside of their safeguarding zones and hidden from radar by topography. The 
Ministry of Defence also raise no objection, subject to condition and informatives. 
 
Warwickshire Wildlife Trust has raised a holding objection to the proposal, 
commenting that the ecological work was lacking in respect of bat surveys. Since 
then, the applicant has commissioned further activity surveys and at the time of 
writing this detail is with the Trust for consideration. RSPB have provided no 
comment. 
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CPRE object to the proposal considering it to be incongruous and adding to built 
form in the landscape, as well as raising concern as to the risk of bat collision, 
disturbance to horses, and that the benefits are not proven to be so great to 
outweigh harm created. 
 
The Council’s Environmental Health officer has considered the noise assessment 
submitted. He raises no objection to the proposal, but in line with guidance requests 
a condition to require the shutdown and rectification of the problem if noise levels 
from the turbine are found to exceed 5dbA above background levels. 
 
Both Baddesley Ensor and Grendon Parish Councils object, with common and 
independent issues raised. These question the scale of the proposal against the 
needs of the farm; the adequacy of the ecological survey, wind speed analysis and 
noise assessment; the visual impact; and that it could set precedent;  
 
At the time of writing, the main consultation period has ended and a total of 21 
neighbour/business representations have been received from 16 separate 
addresses. Whilst this represents just 0.01% of those consulted, in the majority 
those making representations live closest to the site. Issues raised focus on 
landscape and visual impacts, noise and amenity impacts, ecological impacts and 
the potential for setting a precedent. Further issues raised relate to interference to 
TV and radio signals, the need and viability of the turbine, highway safety and 
validity of the wind speed analysis. 
 
Observations 
 
It is not intended to discuss the policy implications and merits of the application at 
this stage given the continuing work to overcome outstanding matters raised either 
by Warwickshire Wildlife Trust, the Case Officer or by the neighbour representations. 
Formal assessment of the application against Development Plan policy and material 
guidance, along with reference to representations made, is intended in time for 
presentation at the September Planning Board. 
 
Notwithstanding this, the visual and landscape impacts can be considered at an 
early stage and without reference to technical reports or qualified opinion. Members 
should be aware of the visualisations and comparisons produced by the applicant, 
which are attached at Appendix A. The Board is therefore asked to consider whether 
a tour of the locale, visiting key vantage points, would be necessary and beneficial. 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the above report is noted, and the Board undertake a site visit prior to 
determination of this application. 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0286 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 The Applicant or Agent 
Application Forms, Supporting 
Documentation and Reports, 
Plans and Visualisations 

1, 8 and 16 
June, 8, 19 
and 21 July 

2011 
2 Coventry Airport Consultation reply 8 June 2011 
3 257 Watling Street Representation 15 June 2011 
4 East Midlands Airport Consultation reply 17 June 2011 

5 Bradley Green Cottage Representation 18 June and 
11 July 2011 

6 The Foalyard Representation (x4) 20 June and 
24 July 2011 

7 Case Officer Notification to Members 20 June 2011 
8 Croft House Representation 20 June 2011 
9 Yew Tree Farm Cottage Representation 21 June 2011 

10 Case Officer Email to Agent (x2) 21 June 2011 
11 Agent Email to Case Officer 21 June 2011 

12 Bradley Green House Representation (x2) 23 June and 8 
July 2011 

13 Brindley Twist Tafft & 
James Solicitors 

Notification of intended 
Representation 23 June 2011 

14 CPRE Consultation reply 23 June 2011 
15 Case Officer Letter to Agent 24 June 2011 
16 Warwickshire Wildlife Trust Consultation reply 24 June 2011 
17 Birmingham Airport Consultation reply 27 June 2011 
18 Case Officer Email to Agent (x2) 27 June 2011 
19 Agent Email to Case Officer 27 June 2011 

20 Head of Development 
Control Formal EIA Screening Opinion 27 June 2011 

21 Alder Mill House Notification of intended 
Representation 27 June 2011 

22 Robert Jennings (PO Box 
1, Atherstone) Representation 28 June 2011 

23 Case Officer Email to Robert Jennings 28 June 2011 
24 Agent Email to Case Officer 28 June 2011 
25 28 Manor Close Representation 28 June 2011 
26 35 Main Street, Orton Representation 28 June 2011 

27 Applicant’s Ecologist Email to Warwickshire Wildlife 
Trust 28 June 2011 

28 Warwickshire Wildlife Trust Email to Applicant’s Ecologist 29 June 2011 

29 107 Watling Street Email to Case Officer (x3) 29 and 30 
June 2011 

30 Alder Mill House/Alder Mill 
Business Park Representation 30 June 2011 

31 Glebe House Representation 1 July 2011 
32 Cllr Sweet Email to Case Officer 4 July 2011 

33 NWBC Environmental 
Health Officer Email to Case Officer (x6) 4, 8 and 11 

July 2011 
34 Case Officer Email to NWBC Environmental 4, 8 and 11 
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Health Officer (x3) July 2011 
35 Agent Email to Case Officer 6 July 2011 
36 150 Watling Street Representation 6 July 2011 

37 Dukes Meadow Representation 8 and 11 July 
2011 

38 1 Farm Lane Representation 9 July 2011 
39 The Orchards Representation 11 July 2011 

40 Baddesley Ensor Parish 
Council Consultation reply 11 July 2011 

41 Grendon Parish Council Consultation reply 24 July 2011 
42 Ministry of Defence Consultation reply 25 July 2011 
43 249a Watling Street Representation (x2) 25 July 2011 
44 5 Green Lane Representation 25 July 2011 
45 Case Officer Email to Agent 28 July 2011 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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(6) Application No PAP/2011/0340 and PAP/2011/0342 
 
Shustoke House Barns, Coleshill Road (B4114), Shustoke  
 
Planning and Listed Building applications for the change of use, alteration and 
extension of redundant farm buildings for use as a wedding/occasions venue, 
including alterations to highway access, access drive and creation of car 
parking for 
 
Merevale and Blyth Estates 
 
Introduction 
 
This proposal is to be referred to the Board at the discretion of the Head of 
Development Control because of its unusual nature and the fact it involves proposals 
for the re-use of a significant range of Listed Buildings within the Green Belt.  
 
In the interim Members may wish to visit the site and thus this report is brought to the 
Board by way of introducing the proposals. 
 
The Site 
 
This is a group of farm buildings and adjoining farm house located about 600 metres 
west of the edge of the village of Shustoke and about 200 metres south of the 
Coleshill Road, immediately adjacent to a large woodland, between the site and 
Castle Lane. The access to the building complex is either via an unmade driveway 
close to the woodland edge or via a long farm track leading across intervening fields 
to the Coleshill Road just east of its junction with Watery Lane. 
 
Shustoke House Farm once related to Shustoke House which stood just to the east 
of the present application site and included a lodge and farm buildings. The House 
was demolished in 1947 and the former lodge, now Shustoke House farmhouse 
together with the range of stables and barns are the subject of the current 
application.  
 
The surrounding area is wholly agricultural in character with only a few dispersed 
residential properties nearby. 
 
The farm house and associated buildings are all Grade 2 Listed Buildings and date 
from around 1772, being a good surviving example of an early model farmstead, and 
have remained very largely unaltered since that time. However they no longer meet 
modern agricultural specifications and are currently unused, the surrounding land 
being farmed from nearby Hall Farm in Shustoke. The farm house is not part of the 
current applications as this is rented separately by the Estate. The List descriptions 
are included in a Heritage Statement, attached at Appendix A.  
 
The Proposals 
 
The proposal is to change the use of this range of buildings to a wedding venue. The 
prospective tenant already operates Wedding Barns in Gloucestershire, and a letter 
is attached at Appendix B from the operator describing the operation in more detail.  
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Appendix C provides a sketch of the existing buildings. The following outlines how 
the barns would be used: 
 

• The West threshing barn – this would become the main entrance and 
reception area, with a partial first floor added. 

• The North threshing barn – this would become the formal wedding ceremony 
space with seating for around 100 people together with the Registrar’s Room. 

• The proposed extension – this would be for dining and after dinner activities 
• The stable building – this would be a private area for the bride, groom and 

families 
• The Cart store – this would be used as the kitchen 
• The Cow Byre and Piggery – these would be used for storage facilities. 

 
The main access into the site would be via improvements to the unmade track 
leading to the field gate access at Watery Lane. This would lead up the barns with an 
extensively landscaped and informal car parking arrangement away from the barns 
sufficient for around 50 cars. Overflow car parking areas would be considered once 
the site was operational.  
 
A fuller description of the works proposed to the barns and a repair schedule is 
attached at Appendix D.  The only proposed extension would be a single storey 
range within the courtyard, the height and depth of which would be subordinate to 
the existing range but still retain the enclosing original “fold” wall as existing. The 
proposed elevations taking into account all of the alterations and the extension are 
set out at Appendix E.  
 
A draft Travel Plan is included. This indicates that there would be in the order of 17 
staff working at the site and a capacity of around 100 for guest numbers. The site is 
not easily accessed by foot or by public transport. The proposed use is neither one 
that would be likely to generate group travel. The Travel Plan therefore concentrates 
on reducing staff reliance on cars, and advertising the use of local taxi firms and 
local private car hire businesses.  
 
The applications are accompanied by other documents not referred to above, 
including a Planning Statement; an Ecological Survey, a Design and Access 
Statement, a Transport Statement, a Flood Risk Assessment, a Phase One Ground 
Conditions Report together with a Preliminary Structural Report.   
 
Development Plan 
 
Saved Policies of the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 – Core Policy 1 (Social 
and Economic Regeneration), Core Policy 2 (Development Distribution), Core Policy 
3 (Natural and Historic Environment), Core Policy 11 (Quality of Development), 
ENV2 (Green Belt), ENV11 (Neighbour Amenities), ENV13 (Building Design), 
ENV14 (Access Design), ENV16 (Listed Buildings), ECON8 (Farm Diversification), 
ECON9 (Re-use of Rural Buildings), TPT3 (Access and Sustainable Travel) and 
TPT6 (Vehicle Parking) 
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Other Material Planning Considerations 
 
Government Planning Policy and Guidance - PPS1 (Delivering Sustainable 
Development), PPG2 (Green Belt), PPS4 (Planning for Sustainable Economic 
Growth), PPS5 (Planning and the Historic Environment), PPS9 (Bio-diversity and 
Geological Conservation) and PPG13 (Transport) 
 
The Government’s Statements – “Plan for Growth” (March 2011), and the 
“Presumption in favour of Sustainable Development” (June 2011). 
 
Observations 
 
When Members come to determine this application, there are three main issues 
which will have to be addressed.  
 
The site lies within the Green Belt, and thus there is a presumption against the grant 
of planning permission for inappropriate development proposals. The re-use of rural 
buildings however need not necessarily be inappropriate subject to a number of 
conditions set out in both Government guidance and Development Plan policy. The 
Board will need to explore these conditions in respect of the current proposals. 
 
The site is also outside of any settlement defined by the North Warwickshire Local 
Plan and thus is in an unsustainable location by definition. The approach of the Local 
Plan is to direct uses and activities as proposed here, to the Borough’s main 
settlements where there is already a range of transport facilities available and where 
existing businesses and uses could benefit directly from increased footfall or 
associated trade. The Board will need to consider whether there are planning 
considerations here that might outweigh this approach. 
 
Moreover in this case, the proposals involve the re-use of Listed Buildings. The 
preferred use of such buildings is always to retain then in their original use. If this is 
not viable, then the proposals should have the least possible intervention or impact 
on the particular attributes and character of the buildings, such that the heritage 
significance of the building is not lost or reduced. The Board will have to determine 
what the heritage significance of this group of buildings is, and then explore whether 
the proposals would retain that significance without significant intervention. 
 
The conclusions from these three issues will then have to be brought together in 
order to consider whether they individually or cumulatively could lead to support 
being given to the proposals or not. Other matters–such as highway, traffic and 
ecological issues will also need to play a role in this final assessment. 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the Board visit the site prior to determination of these applications. 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0340 and PAP/2011/0342 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 The Applicant or Agent Application Forms and Plans 28/6/11 
 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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(7) Application No PAP/2011/0353 
 
West Midland Water Ski Centre, Tamworth Road, Kingsbury  
 
Retention of bund and associated works, 
 
For Parkstone Construction Ltd 
 
Introduction 
 
This application has been submitted to the County Council for determination, and the 
Borough Council has been invited to make representations along with others so as to 
inform that Authority’s assessment of the application. 
 
The Site 
 
The West Midlands Water Ski Centre occupies the Dosthill Lake just north of the 
hamlet of Cliff which itself is two kilometres north of Kingsbury. Access is gained via 
the Tamworth Road (the A51), a short distance east of the lake. To the west is the 
River Tame and to the north is the RSPB nature reserve based at Middleton Hall but 
which extends some way north into Staffordshire.  
 
The lake sits in a small “bowl” with higher land to the east and particularly to the 
north east as it rises towards Dosthill on the edge of Tamworth about 1.5 kilometres 
away. To the south the land rises, less so, but sufficient to “hide” the lake from Cliff. 
There are very few other residential properties in the area. A couple of individual 
houses south of Dosthill do however overlook the lake.  
 
The lake is effectively separated into sections to accommodate different water ski 
activities. The major expanse of open water is to the east (Lake C). Two other areas 
(Lakes A and B) are divided by two intervening bunds or “fingers” of deposited 
material.  The area between the western edge of the lake and the River Tame is 
marked by a further bund which then runs around the northern shores so as to link 
with the other bunds as referred. The overall layout is illustrated at Appendix A.   
 
The bund between the River and Lake A is around 16 metres above water level over 
most of its length – 500 metres - but this reduces at its northern end as it first meets 
the two other bunds and then grades down to water level at the far northern shore of 
the lake. 
 
The main grouping of buildings, including the club house, is on the southern shore 
and these comprise a variety of different buildings, containers, sheds and 
compounds as well as jetties, pontoons and car parking areas. There is boat storage 
area to the rear (south) of theses buildings. Other boats are presently stored on the 
narrow “neck” of land that connects the southern shore to the main bund between 
the River and Lake A. 
 
Public footpaths cross the site from north to south and from east to west.  
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The Proposals 
 
In essence this is to retain the main bund between the River Tame and the lake, as 
defined by the bolder line on Appendix A.   
 
There are three other proposals. The first is to reduce the level of the land 
comprising the narrow “neck” located between location of the buildings and the main 
bund by around 1.5 metres and to provide a hard surface over 107 metres of its 
length (point 3 on Appendix A). The material removed would then be re-deposited on 
the River Tame side of the main bund particularly at its north western end (point 4 on 
Appendix A). The final proposal is to re-grade and re-engineer lake’s outfall into the 
River at its northern end (point 2 on Appendix A). These engineering works at points 
2 and 3 are to increase the frequency of inundation by flood water entering the lake 
from the Tame and then leaving the lake to the north. 
 
The applicant points out that the whole bund contains 293,000 cubic metres of 
material which is “inert” waste – bricks, concrete, gravel and clay. It has been 
provided with a top soil and is now grassed over. He calculates that its removal 
would require some 30,000 HGV movements each way over a period of several 
months depending upon the location of alternative receptor sites. 
 
The application is accompanied by a Visual and Landscape Assessment; an 
Ecological Assessment together with a Flood Risk Assessment.  
 
Background 
 
In order to understand the reason for the submission of this application and its 
content, it is necessary to be aware of the planning background to the site. 
 
The lake was left as a requirement of planning conditions following sand and gravel 
extraction, to be used for recreation purposes. The principle of a water ski centre 
was established following the grant of planning permission in 1998 by the Secretary 
of State following a “call-in” planning inquiry. In view of the developer running into 
funding difficulties, a revised and smaller water ski centre was granted by this 
Council in 2002. This was taken up and provides the basis for the current activity and 
operations at the lake. The principle of having two bunds in the lake was agreed at 
this time. Details of these bunds were subsequently approved. 
 
This was again modified and varied in 2006. Essentially the reason for this 
modification was to introduce winter water skiing to the lake. Work commenced on 
the construction the two lake bunds in late 2006, but during 2007 it became apparent 
that a third bund, significantly greater in height and scale than the two approved 
bunds was being created in the area between the west shore of the lake and the 
River Tame. This operation was unauthorised in breach of planning control, and also 
drew the attention of the Environment Agency with regard to the unlawful deposit of 
waste material as well as significant concerns about the impact of the third bund on 
flood water defences – in effect, the new bund didn’t allow natural overflow into the 
lake.  
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The Environment Agency commenced legal action and was successful in securing 
the cessation of further depositing. However, this did not resolve the concerns over 
the future of the bund. The contractor responsible for the deposit of the waste 
attempted to secure a Certificate of Lawfulness in respect of the bund claiming that it 
was lawful through the grant of planning permission – namely through the 2006 
amendment. This application was reported to Board and was refused in 2008. As a 
consequence the Borough Council resolved that formal Enforcement action seeking 
removal of the third bund was likely to be expedient. However, in considering such 
an outcome, it was clear that any formal requirement to remove the bund would 
result in significant transport, highway and environmental disruption. As an 
alternative, it was resolved that discussion with the contractor and the Environment 
Agency should be ongoing, to explore whether the bund could be retained, albeit 
perhaps in a modified form, such that that Agency’s very real flood concerns could 
be substantially alleviated. If so, then that modified bund could be actually specified 
as a requirement in any Enforcement Notice, or the owners could pick it up through 
the planning process. This is what has happened, as this application is the outcome 
from those very extensive discussions between the Agency, the contractor who 
undertook the works and the County Council.  
 
The application has been submitted to the County Council as Waste Authority. This 
is because the retention of the bund is the retention of deposited waste material 
unrelated to the planning requirements for the use of the lake. In other words the 
bund was not required for the implementation of the 2002 planning permission, even 
as amended in 2006. Rather it was a separate and discreet waste deposit operation. 
 
Development Plan  
 
The Warwickshire Waste Local Plan 1995 to 2005 - Policy 1 (General Land Use)  
 
Saved Policies of the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 – ENV1 (Protection and 
Enhancement of the Natural Landscape), ENV2 (Green Belt), ENV3 (Nature 
Conservation), ENV6 (Land Resources), ENV8 (Water Resources), ENV11 
(Neighbour Amenities), ENV14 (Access Design),  
 
Other Material Planning Considerations 
 
Government Planning Policy – PPS1 (Sustainable Development), PPG2 (Green 
Belts), PPS9 (Biodiversity and Geological Conservation), PPS10 (Planning for 
Sustainable Waste Management), PPG 13 (Transport), PPS25 (Development and 
Flood Risk) 
 
Warwickshire County Council – Waste Development Framework: Core Strategy: 
Emerging Spatial Options Consultation (March 2011) 
 
Observations 
 
a) Introduction 
 
There are a number of issues arising from consideration of this proposal. The 
planning history is clearly a material consideration of significant weight and this is 
now focussed through the Council’s resolution to commence enforcement action. 
The key issue is thus whether the content of this current application is sufficient to 
outweigh the expediency of continuing with that action.  
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There are several material considerations which will have a bearing on this. Firstly, 
the site is in the Green Belt. It will be necessary to determine whether this is 
appropriate or inappropriate development, and if the latter whether there are any 
“very special circumstances” of such weight that might override the presumption of 
refusal.  The visual impact of the bund needs exploration as does whether its 
retention as proposed alleviates the Environment Agency’s flood risk concerns. The 
lake also has significant ecological value and significance primarily as an over 
wintering site for migrating wild fowl and other birds. The Board will recognise all of 
these issues as they reflect those which were examined at the time of the original 
applications and more latterly in the application to introduce winter water skiing at the 
lake and in the resolution to seek removal of the bund. 
 
Before moving on, there are two matters which the Board needs to resolve. It is 
recommended first that it accepts the Environment Agency’s conclusion that the 
waste material deposited here is “inert” and that as a consequence it is not essential 
that it has to be removed as a consequence of it being a potential pollution risk to 
humans or indeed to wildlife. The second is that, notwithstanding this, that the 
removal of the whole bund would be undesirable from a highway point of view. This 
is the current position of the Council as it has asked officers to see if there is a 
“solution” to the various issues here through amendment or modification of the bund, 
such that that outcome could be specified in any Enforcement Notice, if indeed it 
became necessary to issue such a Notice. The report therefore continues on the 
basis that the better solution should, in short, be a modified or amended “bund”. 
 
b) Green Belt 
 
The development under consideration here arises from the deposit of waste material 
– in other words an engineering operation. Government advice in its PPG2 clearly 
says that such operations would be inappropriate development unless they maintain 
the openness of the Green Belt and do not conflict with the purposes of including 
land within the Green Belt. The Council has already taken the view that this bund is 
an artificial feature in the landscape which is unnatural in appearance and because 
of its size, scale and location is out of scale and character in this vicinity. Nothing has 
changed to alter this conclusion.  
 
It is accepted that the area around Dosthill Lake, particularly to the north and west as 
well as to the south, is very much part of an unnatural landscape in any event due to 
the extensive former sand and gravel extraction and the retention of the resultant 
landscape as a series of pools, lakes and artificial land forms. Much of the flood plain 
here has this visual appearance. The applicant considers that this bund is just one of 
a number of such features throughout this flood plain and thus not unusual in this 
context. Moreover it is mainly viewed in the landscape by the general public from the 
surrounding road network and thus, because of the land profiles, is seen from above. 
All of this is accepted but does not alter the initial conclusion. There are reasons for 
this. This bund is large – in height and length. It is the largest such feature in the 
immediate area. It is out of scale, and very linear in profile. It is thus noticeable. The 
Board will be aware that there are a number of public footpaths crossing this area 
and these are very well used. Moreover there are significant numbers of visitors to 
the centre itself and to the RSPB reserve on the other side of the River. The 
applicant’s own analysis provided with the application, can not disguise the 
conclusion that the views from water level around and in the vicinity of the bund are 
adversely affected by the scale of this bund. The perception of openness is lost in 
short and medium length views from a number of locations in and around the lake. 
Additionally it is particularly visible from the higher ground to the south between Cliff 
and the centre. As a consequence, bearing in mind the landscape context; the 
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surrounding land profiles, the size and character of the bund and its visibility at water 
and lower ground levels, it is concluded that the bund has slight to moderate adverse 
visual impacts, and that as a consequence it does not maintain openness.  
 
The second “limb” of the appropriateness test for engineering operations in the 
Green Belt was that they would not conflict with the purposes of including land in the 
Green Belt. There are five purposes set out in PPG2 - to check “unrestricted sprawl” 
of large built up areas; to prevent towns merging together, to safeguard countryside 
from encroachment, to preserve the setting of historic towns and to assist in urban 
regeneration. It is considered that the retention of this bund does not conflict with any 
of these purposes. 
 
It is thus considered that the bund in its present form is inappropriate development in 
the Green Belt, in that it has an adverse impact on the openness of that Green Belt, 
but that this, whilst significant, is not of overriding weight as the bund does not 
conflict with the purposes of land being in the Green Belt. 
 
c) Flood Risk 
 
The flood alleviation proposals within this application have been worked up with the 
active involvement of the Environment Agency. It is accepted that provided the 
Agency does not lodge an objection, or require further modification through its 
response to the County Council, that these will be acceptable and thus improve the 
situation to a material degree. The two alterations described above have no real 
visual or other impact and are thus considered to be neutral in terms of their affect 
on the openness of the area. Overall, these alleviation works are a benefit of the 
application that should carry substantial weight.  
 
d) Ecology  
 
The ornithological interest in this site has always been substantive, and has shaped 
the original planning permission as well as subsequent amendments. In short, this is 
because the lake has been used as an over-wintering area for migrating wildfowl. 
The key to this has been the open expanse of the actual lake itself, within an area of 
several other lakes, pools and of course the River itself. The initial planning 
permission only permitted summer water skiing as a consequence. The later 
proposals to introduce winter water ski activity thus raised major concerns. Following 
extensive consultation with the appropriate ornithological bodies, it was agreed that 
because the lake could already be sub-divided by the bunds approved in 2002, that 
limited winter skiing could take place towards the western side of the lake, leaving 
the greater expanse of water to the east free to fulfil the over-wintering role. The third 
bund along the River Tame bank was never approved. The issue is thus whether its 
retention will have an adverse impact of the lake as an over-wintering location for 
migrating wildfowl. 
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It is not considered that the applicant has submitted the evidence to draw such a 
conclusion. Crucially there does not appear to be an analysis of bird counts on a 
species by species basis over time, with the necessary assessment of any emerging 
patterns or an assessment of these on the significance of each species. Moreover it 
appears that the emphasis of the work undertaken was to look at the potential impact 
of the bund on the reserves on the western side of the River not on the lake itself. An 
overall impact analysis is thus not fully available. At the present time therefore it is 
considered that the ecological impacts of retaining the bund as it presently exists 
have not been fully assessed.  
 
e) Highway Implications 
 
As indicated above, it is agreed that the removal of the bund would have significant 
adverse traffic, highway and environmental impacts, to the extent that it should be 
avoided if it all possible. Hence the need to find a solution that can be accepted by 
other interests. The following section brings these matters together. 
 
f) Mitigation Measures 
 
The Environment Agency has been fully involved in the measures proposed in this 
application to reduce the worse flooding impacts arising from the retention of the 
bund. As these will have little impact on the visual or ornithological interests here, 
they can be supported. 
 
The applicant accepts that there is presently slight to moderate adverse visual 
impacts but considers that these are not so significant to lead to a refusal largely 
because they can be mitigated through additional planting. It is important to say that 
this does not mean extensive woodland planting as the presence of a large number 
of trees will reduce the perceived openness of the water surface by migrating 
wildfowl; act as new habitats for other species that could harm nesting birds, and 
provide “perches” for raptors during the over wintering period. The landscaping 
proposed is thus for appropriate low level shrubs and other species at lower levels 
around the bund, that are naturally self-regenerating requiring little ongoing 
maintenance. This would be very similar to the vegetation that is now seen in the 
RSPB reserve on the western side of the River. This new landscaping is welcomed 
and necessary, but it still does not address the crucial issue that the present bund is 
too high and too linear. The top of the bund has to remain open and free from 
pedestrian access for ornithological reasons, but this can still be achieved with 
varying heights, and some flattening. It is accepted that due to the proximity of the 
bund to the River that re-profiling along its western bottom edge would be difficult, 
but the eastern shore would provide an opportunity to enable the edge of the bund to 
be sculpted to form smaller coves or inlets along the shore with varying depths of 
water, thus providing different habitats.  The applicant should be reminded that this 
bund is unauthorised and that there is a Council resolution to issue a Notice to have 
it removed or modified in such a way as to mitigate its adverse visual impact. The 
current proposals do not achieve sufficient satisfactory mitigation for the Council to 
re-consider its position. 
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It is not considered that the case has been made via the evidence currently 
submitted that the retention of the bund has not had an adverse impact on the over-
wintering habits of significant numbers of wildfowl. Until the County Council has been 
satisfied on this issue, it is not considered that any support should be given to the 
current proposal to retain the bund as it is. The County should be consulting the 
RSPB, the West Midlands Bird Club, its own ecologist and principally the British 
Trust for Ornithology all of whom have been heavily involved before in this site. If 
these agencies are satisfied then the matter is resolved. If not, it is necessary to see 
what amendments are needed to be made to the bund in order to achieve their 
agreement. In such a scenario of course, the other planning considerations come 
into play – particularly if the bund has to be lowered by a significant degree.  
 
g) Conclusions 
 
This application is a County matter because it deals with the deposit of waste 
material. This report has not focussed or centred on waste planning policies because 
the application is to retain the deposit of waste at this site; because the highway 
impact of its removal would be significantly adverse, and because the nature of the 
waste material is inert. It was thus considered more relevant to concentrate on the 
planning considerations arising from the retention of the bund in its present form. In 
this respect it is considered that the issue of whether or not this is an appropriate 
location in principle for the deposit of this waste material is not necessarily the main 
issue. The Council’s position is that in its present form it is not appropriate 
development in the Green Belt, but that with modification it may be, providing that it 
does not have significant adverse impacts on the openness of the Green Belt 
hereabouts; on the flood water capability of the area, and the ornithological value of 
the lake.  The present proposals however only achieve satisfactory conclusion on 
one of these impacts – the flood alleviation measures.  
 
The County Council should be advised accordingly. 
 
  
Recommendation 
 
That the County Council be informed that,  
 
“This Council’s position is that the retention of the bund in its present form is 
unacceptable in that it is inappropriate development in the Green Belt, and that there 
are no very special circumstances of such weight to warrant overriding the 
presumption of refusal. This is because it is considered that the bund has an adverse 
visual impact on the openness of the Green Belt hereabouts; that it is adversely 
affecting the flood water capability of the lake, and that it has not be shown that it is 
having no adverse impact on the ornithological value of the lake. The current 
proposals only satisfy the Council in respect of one of these impacts – namely the 
proposed flood capacity measures. The remaining impacts are not sufficiently 
addressed for the Council to conclude that the retention of the bund would have no 
adverse impacts. As such it is still not considered that the very special circumstances 
have been shown to warrant overriding the presumption of refusal to this 
inappropriate development in the Green Belt. The County Council is thus requested 
to require the re-profiling of the bund to the extent that it has no adverse impact on 
the openness of the Green Belt, and that it satisfies itself through the appropriate 
consultation process, that there is no adverse impact on the lake’s ornithological 
value”. 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0353 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 The Applicant or Agent Application Forms and Plans 4/7/11 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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(8) Application No PAP/2011/0370 
 
Land Off Lower House Lane Lower House Lane Baddesley Ensor   
 
Variation of condition no:- 3 of planning permission NWB/10CC045 to extend 
the timescales for submission of a traffic management scheme, for 
 
Warwickshire County Council 
 
Introduction 
 
The Council has been invited to comment on this application by the County Council 
as part of the consultation process it is undertaking. It is reported to Board in light of 
the Board’s interest in the original proposals for this development. 
 
The Site 
 
This is on the west side of Lower House Lane within the area of Phase 2 of the Birch 
Coppice Distribution Park and in the vicinity of the former Lower House Farm. 
 
Background to the Proposal 
 
Members will recall that the County Council granted planning permission here for a 
Household Waste Recycling Centre and a Waste Transfer Station in October 2010. 
That permission was subject to many conditions. One of these – condition 3 – 
requires the submission of a traffic management scheme to be approved by the 
Highway Authority. This scheme is to include measures for proposed speed 
restrictions; associated works and signage. The condition requires receipt of the 
scheme within six months of the date of the permission – by April 2011. The County 
Council is seeking further time – until October 2011. 
 
Development Plan 
 
Saved Policy from the North Warwickshire Local Plan 2006 – ENV14 (Access 
Design) 
 
Observations 
 
There is no objection to this proposed variation. Work on preparing the site for this 
development to a very great extent is governed by the Birch Coppice Phase 2 
ground works and infrastructure provision so the project has been slightly delayed 
already as a consequence. Additionally whilst the traffic management scheme is 
currently being designed and prepared, it has not yet been formally submitted. The 
time period proposed is reasonable given these circumstances. 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the Council does not object 
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BACKGROUND PAPERS 
 
Local Government Act 1972 Section 100D, as substituted by the Local Government Act, 
2000 Section 97 
 
Planning Application No: PAP/2011/0370 
 
Background 

Paper No Author Nature of Background Paper Date 

1 Warwickshire County 
Council 

Letter 7/7/11 

 
Note: This list of background papers excludes published documents which may be referred to in the report, such as The 

Development Plan and Planning Policy Guidance Notes. 
 

A background paper will include any item which the Planning Officer has relied upon in preparing the report and 
formulating his recommendation.  This may include correspondence, reports and documents such as 
Environmental Impact Assessments or Traffic Impact Assessments. 
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